PROPOSAL NO. 14336
OPENED: MARCH 23, 2004

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

For the furnishing and delivery of VARIOUS
PAPER PRODUCTS for a twelve-month
period beginning April 1, 2004 and ending
March 31, 2005 to the City and County of
Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

ITEM
NO. GROUP |
1. Multi-fold type
Bid Price Unit 8,000 cases
Total

Maufacturer's Brand Name and Number:

Price Per Sheet of Paper Hand Towel:
Sheets/package and packages/case:

GROUP I

Roll type

Bid Price Unit 500 cases
Total

Maufacturer's Brand Name and Number:

Price Per Sheet of Paper Hand Towel:
Sheets/package and packages/case:

Dispenser

Bid Price Unit 200 each
Total

Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number:

Material Construction:

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROURP I:

HOPACO CONRAD MALOLO CICO KYD INC.
ENTERPRISES BEVERAGES ENTERPRISE
INC. & LTD.
SUPPLIES LTD.
$12.83 $14.04 $13.92 $12.84 $14.25
$102,640.00 $112,320.00 $111,360.00 $102,720.00 $114,000.00
Georgia Pacific Kimberly-Clark Kimberly-Clark Georgia Pacific Acclaim 20205
Acclaim - KIM-01804 No. 1804 20205
W5-20205
.00320 .000351 | $0.00348 per sheet 0.0032035 .003563
334 sh/pk 12 pk/ct 250/pkg [200 sheets/package| 334 shts/12 pkgs/ 333/package
16 pkg/case| 20 packages/case 4008 12 pk/cs
NO BID $34.06 $34.94 $33.82 $19.35
2&3 $17,030.00 $17,470.00 $16,910.00 $9,675.00
Kimberly-Clark Kimberly-Clark KC-04142| GP Acclaim 26601
KIM-04142 No. 04142

.042575| $0.00364 per feet| - 3.23/roll .004038
800"/roll 800'/per roll| 800'x8" 12 rolls/cs| 800/roll 6 rolls/cs

12 rolls/case

$35.36
$7,072.00
Kimberly-Clark
KIM-09073

Abuse resistant material,

smoke/putty finish
$24,102.00

12 rolls/per case

$34.86
$6,972.00
Kimberly-Clark
No. 09073 (D2)

$24,442.00

$34.84
$6,968.00
KC-09073

as specified

$23,878.00

$29.67
$5,934.00
Georgia Pacific
54337

Hi Impact Plastic

$15,609.00
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HOPACO CONRAD MALOLO Cico KYD INC.
ENTERPRISES BEVERAGES ENTERPRISE
INC. & LTD.
SUPPLIES LTD.
ITEM
NO. GROUP llI
4. Roll type
Bid Price Unit 1,100 cases $31.81 $34.06 $34.94 $31.86 $35.333
Total $34,991.00 $37,466.00 $38,434.00 $35,046.00 $38,866.30
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Georgia Pacific Kimberly-Clark Kimberly-Clark Georgia Pacific Acclaim 14500
Acclaim - KIM-05102 No. 5102 14500
W5-14500
Price Per Sheet of Toilet Tissue: .000331 .000355 $0.000364 0.000331875 .000368
Sheets/roll and rolls/case: 1000 sh/roll 1,000 sheets/roll 1000 sheets/roll| 1000 shts/96 rolls 1000 sheets/roll
96 rolls/ct 96 rolls/case 96 rolls/case 96 rolls/case
5. Inter-fold type
Bid Price Unit 600 cases $35.93 NO BID NO BID $35.87 $39.781
Total $21,558.00 5-7 $21,522.00 $23,868.60
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Georgia Pacific Georgia Pacific Acclaim 10101
Acclaim - 10101
W5 10101
Price Per Sheet of Toilet Tissue: .0007485 0.0007472 .001591
Sheets/Package and Packages/Case: 800 sh/pk 60 pk/ct 800 shts/60 pkgs 400 sheets/roll
60 rolls/cs
GROUP IV
6. Half-fold type
Bid Price Unit 400 cases $29.56 $29.64 $29.60 $32.656
Total $11,824.00 $11,856.00 $11,840.00 $13,062.40
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Georgia Pacific| Rochester Midland Georgia Pacific Georgia Pacific
Renaissance ROC-SORA-IMP 47046 47046
W5-47046
Price Per Sheet of Toilet Seat Cover: .005912 .005928 0.00592 .006531
Sheets/Package and Packages/Case: 250 sh/pk 20 pk/ct 250 sheets/pkg 250/20/5000 250/pk 20 pk/cs

20 pkg/case
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HOPACO CONRAD MALOLO CICO KYD INC.
ENTERPRISES BEVERAGES ENTERPRISE
INC. & LTD.
SUPPLIES LTD.
ITEM
NO. GROUP V
7. For personal hygiene sanitary napkin
disposal
Bid Price Unit 75 cartons NO BID $13.26 $13.46 NO BID
Total $994.50 $1,009.50
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Westland Papercon Papercon R75
PLS-R75
Price Per Sheet of Bag: .01326 0.01346
Packages/Carton: 1,000/case 1000/cs




