
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14324 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  MARCH 22, 2004

For the furnishing and delivery of VARIOUS
CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT NO. 3, ALLIED AMERICAN BACON HT&T PACIFIC SUN WESTERN
2003 - 2004 to the Board of Water Supply, MACHINERY MACHINERY UNIVERSAL TRUCK MACHINERY INDUSTRIES MACHINERY
City and County of Honolulu, Honolulu, CORPORATION CO. INC. CENTER INC. INC. LLC
Hawaii

ITEM
NO.
1. One (1) Only, 8,000 Lbs. Capacity,

Non-Towable Forklift
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Case 588G Hyster H80XM Komatsu DP40K-D2 

FD40ZT2-8 

Year of production: 2004 ----- 2004 2004 
Bid Price $44,478.88 $41,984.11 $28,801.90 NO BID $33,339.74 NO BID NO BID

1 - 5 1 - 3
Delivery in calendar days: 180 days

2. Two (2) Only, Rubber Track Compact
Excavator with Attachments
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Case CX36, Hitachi Z35U Komatsu Caterpillar 303CR Bobcat 430 ZHS 

Tramac TR-6, PC35MR-2 
Werk-Brav Multi-Tine 

Year of production model: 2004 2004 2004 2004 2004 
Bid Price Unit 2 units $47,083.03 $41,666.48 $45,103.88 $45,500.00 $42,812.12

Total $94,166.06 $83,332.96 $90,207.76 $91,000.00 $85,624.24

Delivery in calendar days: 180 days

3. Two (2) Only, Rubber Tired skid Steer
Loader with Attachments
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Case 40 XT, FFC Sweeper, FFC New Holland Caterpillar 232B Bobcat S175 

Bucket, Case CH300 Hammer, LS160 
D-125 Backhoe, Pallet Forks 

Year of production model: 2004 2004 2004 2004 
Bid Price Unit 2 units $43,958.05 NO BID $44,270.55 $49,500.00 $39,255.51

Total $87,916.10 3 - 8 $88,541.10 $99,000.00 $78,511.02

Delivery in calendar days: 180 days
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ALLIED AMERICAN BACON HT&T PACIFIC SUN WESTERN
MACHINERY MACHINERY UNIVERSAL TRUCK MACHINERY INDUSTRIES MACHINERY

CORPORATION CO. INC. CENTER INC. INC. LLC

ITEM
NO.
4. Two (2) Only, Two-Wheel Mounted Portable

Solar/Battery Powered Traffic Advisory
Controller Board
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Wanco WVTM-S 

Year of production model: 2004 
Bid Price Unit 2 units NO BID NO BID $20,649.96

Total 4 & 5 NO BID $41,299.92 NO BID
4 - 6 4 - 8

Delivery in calendar days: 180 days

5. One (1) Only, 10.0 KW 2-Wheel Mounted,
Portable Combination Light Tower-Electric
Generating Set-Welder Unit with Protective
Housing
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Multiquip 

MLTSDW7 

Year of production model: 2004 
Bid Price $13,333.25 NO BID

5 - 8
Delivery in calendar days: 180 days

6. One (1) Only, 300 Gallons Trailer Mounted
Stainless Steel Water Tank
Manufacturer's make and model no.: West-Mark 300 West-Mark West-Mark Model 300 

Gallon Tank Trailer 300 gal Water SSPWTT Stainless Steel 

Buffalo Portable Water Tank Trailer 

Year of production model: 2004 2004 2004 
Bid Price $33,624.78 $30,989.39 $31,643.90

Delivery in calendar days: 180 days
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ALLIED AMERICAN BACON HT&T PACIFIC SUN WESTERN
MACHINERY MACHINERY UNIVERSAL TRUCK MACHINERY INDUSTRIES MACHINERY

CORPORATION CO. INC. CENTER INC. INC. LLC

ITEM
NO.
7. Two (2) Only, 25,000 Lbs. GVWR Trailer

Manufacturer's make and model no.: Zieman 2660-A Zieman 2660 A Zieman 2660-A 

Year of production model: 2004 2004 2004 
Bid Price Unit 2 units $16,145.73 $16,354.06 $18,749.88

Total $32,291.46 $32,708.12 NO BID $37,499.76
7 & 8

Delivery in calendar days: 180 days

8. One (1) Only, 28,700 Lbs. GVWR Trailer
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Zieman 2715-A Zieman 2715 Zieman 2715 

Year of production model: 2004 2004 2004 
Bid Price $19,270.71 $19,791.54 $22,916.52

Delivery in calendar days: 180 days


