PROPOSAL NO. 14306
OPENED: FEBRUARY 23, 2004

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

For the furnishing and delivery of VARIOUS
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS, for the twelve-
month period beginning April 1, 2004 and
ending March 31, 2005 to the Honolulu
Police Department, City and County of
Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

ITEM
NO.
1. Idler Arm, Moog D8283
Bid Price Unit 120 each
Total
Manufacturer's brand & part no.:
2. Pitman Arm, Moog K8688
Bid Price Unit 60 each
Total
Manufacturer's brand & part no.:
3. Upper Ball Joint, Moog K8678
Bid Price Unit 120 each
Total
Manufacturer's brand & part no.:
4. Lower Ball Joint, Moog K8685
Bid Price Unit 120 each
Total
Manufacturer's brand & part no.:
5. Sway Bar Link Kit, Moog K8853
Bid Price Unit 80 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

ALOHA AUTOMOTIVE | AUTOMOTIVE | CHARLES W. CUTTER HONOLULU PACIFIC PACIFIC
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS WAREHOUSE | CARTER CO. FORD INC. FORD INC. JOBBERS MACHINERY,
DISTRIBUTING | DISTRIBUTOR, INC. HAWAII WAREHOUSE INC.

INC. INC.
ltems 1 - 47
$41.33 $48.03 $39.12 $28.49 $23.49 NO BID $46.00 $55.58
$4,959.60 $5,763.60 $4,694.40 $3,418.80 $2,818.80 $5,520.00 $6,669.60
Moog K8283 SPC450-1042 Moog Parts Master Ford OE Moog K8283 TRW 18833
K8283 IWIZ3355AA
$24.60 $43.29 $23.44 $28.76 $27.98 $28.00 $33.29
$1,476.00 $2,597.40 $1,406.40 $1,725.60 $1,678.80 $1,680.00 $1,997.40
Moog K8688 SPC450-1064 |Moog Moog K8688 Ford OE Moog K8688 TRW 190143
F8AZ3590AA
$33.32 $40.84 $20.57 $38.94 $46.65 $37.00 $44.39
$3,998.40 $4,900.80 $2,468.40 $4,672.80 $5,598.00 $4,440.00 $5,326.80
Moog K8678 SPC 500-1088 |Moog Moog K8678 Ford OE Moog K8678 TRW 104225
F7AZ3049AA
$30.68 $35.96 $28.61 $35.86 $69.87 $34.00 $40.64
$3,681.60 $4,315.20 $3,433.20 $4,303.20 $8,384.40 $4,080.00 $4,876.80
Moog K8685 SPC505-1223 Moog Moog K8685 Ford OE Moog K8685 TRW 104226
2W7Z3050AA
$29.38 $30.60 $26.86 $34.34 $34.50 $32.00 $38.01
$2,350.40 $2,448.00 $2,148.80 $2,747.20 $2,760.00 $2,560.00 $3,040.80
Moog K8853 SPC545-1093 Moog Moog K8853 Ford OE Moog K8853 TRW 18156

F8AZ5K484AA




Page 2

ITEM
NO.

10.

Upper Control Arm Bushings, Moog K8703
Bid Price Unit 120 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Lower Control Arm Bushings, Moog K8297
Bid Price Unit 120 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Lower Control Arm Bushings, Moog 80029
Bid Price Unit 65 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Inner Tie Rod End, Moog ES3495
Bid Price Unit

Total
Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

60 each

Outer Tie Rod End, Moog ES3494

Bid Price Unit 60 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

ALOHA AUTOMOTIVE | AUTOMOTIVE | CHARLES W. CUTTER HONOLULU PACIFIC PACIFIC
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS WAREHOUSE | CARTER CO. FORD INC. FORD INC. JOBBERS MACHINERY,
DISTRIBUTING | DISTRIBUTOR, INC. HAWAII WAREHOUSE INC.

INC. INC.
$10.08 $11.60 $9.25 $11.78 $92.08 $12.00 $9.72
$1,209.60 $1,392.00 $1,110.00 $1,413.60 $11,049.60 $1,440.00 $1,166.40
Moog K8703 SPC560-1060 |Moog Moog K8703 Ford (R/S)F6AZ Moog K8703 TRW 12732
3885BA
(L/S)F7AZ3084BA
w/control arms
$14.94 $9.06 $13.72 $13.92 $135.36 $16.49 $9.75
$1,792.80 $1,087.20 $1,646.40 $1,670.40 $16,243.20 $1,978.80 $1,170.00
Moog K8279 SPC565-1057 Moog Parts Master Ford OE Moog K8297 TRW 12506
K8297 XWIZ3078BA
XWIZ3079BA
w/control arms
$24.02 $14.74 $21.95 $28.08 $135.36 $26.49| Items 8- 15
$1,561.30 $958.10 $1,426.75 $1,825.20 $8,798.40 $1,721.85 NO BID
Moog K80029 SPC565-1132 Moog Moog K80029 Ford OE Moog K80029
XWIZ3078BA
XWIZ3079BA
w/control arms
$17.50 $21.24 $16.16 $20.46 $19.87 $19.49
$1,050.00 $1,274.40 $969.60 $1,227.60 $1,192.20 $1,169.40
Moog ES3495 |SPC401-1632 Moog Moog ES3495 Ford OE Moog ES3495
2W7Z3A130AA
$17.50 $21.24 $16.16 $20.46 $19.87 $19.49
$1,050.00 $1,274.40 $969.60 $1,227.60 $1,192.20 $1,169.40
Moog ES3494 |SPC401-1633 Moog Moog ES3494  |Ford OE Moog ES3494
2W7Z3A131AA
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ITEM
NO.
11.

12.

13.

14.

15.

Starter, Bosch SR7533X

Bid Price Unit 40 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Water Pump, Air Tex AW5033

Bid Price Unit 25 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Alternator, Bosch AL7537N

Bid Price Unit 150 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Alternator, Bosch AL7554X

Bid Price Unit 150 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Power Steering Pump, A Cardone 20-260
Bid Price
Core Charge Unit 20 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

ALOHA AUTOMOTIVE | AUTOMOTIVE | CHARLES W. CUTTER HONOLULU PACIFIC PACIFIC
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS WAREHOUSE | CARTER CO. FORD INC. FORD INC. JOBBERS MACHINERY,
DISTRIBUTING | DISTRIBUTOR, INC. HAWAII WAREHOUSE INC.

INC. INC.
$209.09
Core $40.00 Core (-$78.12)
$91.25 $126.66 NO BID $97.49 $130.97 $93.49
$5,250.00 $5,066.40 $3,899.60 $5,238.80 $3,739.60
Vapex 32.67 BEC186-0757 Bosch Ford OE Bosch SR7533X
SR7533X F7UZ11002AARM
$19.99 $28.56 $18.10 $24.41 NO BID $26.99
$499.75 $714.00 $452.50 $610.25 $674.75
Airtex AW5033 |AIRAW5033 Airtex 5033 Airtex Carter FP1877
AW5033
235.97
Core $56.00 Core(-$78.12)
$107.05 $136.50 NO BID $129.16 $157.85 $189.49
$24,457.50 $20,475.00 $19,374.00 $23,677.50 $28,423.50
Vapex 7776 BEC186-6262 Bosch Ford OE Bosch AL7537N
AL7537X F6PZ10346EARMI
$246.65
Core $60.00 Core (-$78.12)
$104.68 $155.79 NO BID $126.74 $168.53 $119.49
$24,702.00 $23,368.50 $19,011.00 $25,279.50 $17,923.50
Vapex 7793 BEC186-6305 Bosch Ford OE Bosch
AL7554X F8AZ10346 AL7554X
ABRM
199.17
Core $28.00 Core (-$50.00) |Core (-$50.00) |Core (-$50.00) |Core (-$41.67)
$65.96 $104.87 $48.36 $130.96 $157.50 NO BID
$1,879.20 $1,097.40 $1,967.20 $1,619.20 $3,150.00
ARI 50-6391 AOC20-260 Cardone Cardone Ford OE
20-260 F85Z3A674ABRM
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ITEM
NO.
16.

17.

18.

19.

20.

Brake Pads, Wagner SX748

Bid Price Unit 100 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Brake Pads, Wagner SX659

Bid Price Unit 135 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Brake Pads, Wagner MX674A

Bid Price Unit 135 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Brake Pads, Wagner MX674

Bid Price Unit 95 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Parking Brake Shoes, Wagner PAB701

Bid Price Unit 60 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

ALOHA AUTOMOTIVE | AUTOMOTIVE | CHARLES W. CUTTER HONOLULU PACIFIC PACIFIC
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS WAREHOUSE | CARTER CO. FORD INC. FORD INC. JOBBERS MACHINERY,
DISTRIBUTING | DISTRIBUTOR, INC. HAWAII WAREHOUSE INC.

INC. INC.
$27.12 $56.53 $29.18 $38.78 $36.21 $28.00 $58.69
$2,712.00 $5,653.00 $2,918.00 $3,878.00 $3,621.00 $2,800.00 $5,869.00
ARI 64D748 RAY PGD7480S |GMD 748F Wagner SX748 |Ford OE Centri Brakes Performance
Raybestos XU2Z2V001AB 104.07480 Friction
074810
$28.72 $49.24 $28.00 $36.22 $32.61 $23.00 $49.59
$3,877.20 $6,647.40 $3,780.00 $4,889.70 $4,402.35 $3,105.00 $6,694.65
ARI| 64D659 RAY PGD659QS|GMD 659F Wagner SX659 |For OE Centri Brakes Performance
Raybestos 2UZZ2V001KA 104.06990 Friction
065910
$16.72 $32.87 $18.86 $30.64 $33.04 $31.50 $43.17
$2,257.20 $4,437.45 $2,546.10 $4,136.40 $4,460.40 $4,252.50 $5,827.95
ARI 63D690 RAY PGD674AM|GMD 674F Wagner Ford OE Raybestos Performance
Raybestos MX674A XU2Z2V001VA PGD674AM Friction
069020
$21.52 $32.87 $30.53 $31.91 $27.56 $31.50 $42.72
$2,044.40 $3,122.65 $2,900.35 $3,031.45 $2,618.20 $2,992.50 $4,058.40
ARI 62D674 RAY PGD674M |BMD 674 Wagner Ford OE Raybestos Performance
MX674 2U272V001CA PGD674M Friction
067420
Core $5.00
$14.32 $14.53 $8.50 $11.36 $75.97 $13.99| Items 20 - 22
$1,159.20 $871.80 $510.00 $681.60 $4,558.20 $839.40
ARI 72-701 RAY 701PG BS701 Parts Master Ford OE Raybestos
Raybestos FB701 XL2Z2648AA 701PG
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ITEM
NO.
21.

22.

23.

24.

25.

Brake Rotor, Wagner BD125618

Bid Price Unit 100 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Brake Rotor, Wagner BD125506

Bid Price Unit 100 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Brake Rotor, Wagner BD125514

Bid Price Unit 100 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Brake Pads, Wagner MX814

Bid Price Unit 45 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Brake Pads, Wagner SX699

Bid Price Unit 45 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

ALOHA AUTOMOTIVE | AUTOMOTIVE | CHARLES W. CUTTER HONOLULU PACIFIC PACIFIC
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS WAREHOUSE | CARTER CO. FORD INC. FORD INC. JOBBERS MACHINERY,
DISTRIBUTING | DISTRIBUTOR, INC. HAWAII WAREHOUSE INC.

INC. INC.
$22.32 $67.96 $23.61 $24.34 NO BID $45.00
$2,232.00 $6,796.00 $2,361.00 $2,434.00 $4,500.00
ARI 789-36055 |RAY 56641 Raybestos Parts Master Centri Brakes
55034 125504 120.62055
$15.12 $57.67 $20.89 $19.94 NO BID $35.00
$1,512.00 $5,767.00 $2,089.00 $1,994.00 $3,500.00
ARI 789-36058 |RAY 56629 Raybestos Parts Master Centri Brakes
55039 125506 120.62058
$27.12 $58.24 $36.60 $32.34 $61.95 $48.00 $111.68
$2,712.00 $5,824.00 $3,660.00 $3,234.00 $6,195.00 $4,800.00 $11,168.00
ARI 789-34055 |RAY 66744 Raybestos Parts Master Ford OE Centri Brakes Performance
54060 125514 \ YW7Z1V125EA 120.61055 | Friction
31506601
$17.52 $37.24 NO BID $18.02 $68.71 $36.49 $31.55
$788.40 $1,675.80 $810.90 $3,091.95 $1,642.05 $1,419.75
ARI| 62D698 RAY PGD698 Parts Master GM OE Raybestos Performance
MD814 18029828 PGD698 Friction
081420
$23.92 $56.96 NO BID $43.65 $64.45 $23.00 $46.28
$1,076.40 $2,563.20 $1,964.25 $2,900.25 $1,035.00 $2,082.60
ARI 64D699 RAY PGD699QS Wagner SX699 |GM OE Centri Brakes Performance
18045380 104.06990 Friction

069910
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ITEM
NO.
26.

27.

28.

29.

30.

Brake Pads, Wagner MX614
Bid Price Unit
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Brake Pads, Wagner MX628
Bid Price Unit
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Brake Pads, Wagner MX376
Bid Price Unit
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Brake Pads, Wagner MX714
Bid Price Unit
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Brake Pads, Wagner PD750
Bid Price Unit
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

45 each

40 each

40 each

40 each

40 each

ALOHA AUTOMOTIVE | AUTOMOTIVE | CHARLES W. CUTTER HONOLULU PACIFIC PACIFIC
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS WAREHOUSE | CARTER CO. FORD INC. FORD INC. JOBBERS MACHINERY,
DISTRIBUTING | DISTRIBUTOR, INC. HAWAII WAREHOUSE INC.

INC. INC.
$22.32 $38.44 $17.74 $17.35 $57.31 $23.00 $36.25
$1,004.40 $1,729.80 $798.30 $780.75 $2,578.95 $1,035.00 $1,631.25
ARI 62D614 RAY PGD614M |Raybestos Parts Master GM OE Centri Brakes Performance
BMD 614 MD614 18029154 104.06140 Friction
061420
$19.92 $33.39 $17.27 $24.02 $50.00 $32.50 $38.29
$796.80 $1,335.60 $690.80 $960.80 $2,000.00 $1,300.00 $1,531.60
ARI 62D628 RAY PGD628M |Raybestos Parts Master GM OE Raybestos Performance
BMD 628 MD628 18029163 PGD628M Friction
062820
$19.12 $34.84 $18.58 $12.66 $57.24 $33.99 $32.67
$764.80 $1,393.60 $743.20 $506.40 $2,289.60 $1,359.60 $1,306.80
ARI 62D376 RAY PGD376M |Raybestos Parts Master GM OE Raybestos Performance
BMD 376 MD376 18024931 PGD376M Friction
037620
$18.32 $33.90 $19.20 $26.58 $63.50 $32.99 NO BID
$732.80 $1,356.00 $768.00 $1,063.20 $2,540.00 $1,319.60
ARI| 62D714 RAY PGD714M |Raybestos Wagner MX714 |GM OE Raybestos
BMD 714 18043995 PGD714M
$15.92 $30.81 $15.21 $26.03 $117.87 $29.99 NO BID
$636.80 $1,232.40 $608.40 $1,041.20 $4,714.80 $1,199.60
ARI 63D750 RAY PGD750 Raybestos Parts Master GM OE Raybestos
BD 750 D750 18026298 PGD750
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ITEM
NO.
31.

32.

33.

34.

35.

Brake Pads, Wagner MX749
Bid Price Unit

Total
Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

40 each

Front Hub, BCA Federal Mogul Bearings,
51304
Bid Price Unit 30 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Front Hub, CBA Federal Mogul Bearings,
51302

Bid Price Unit 30 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Shocks, Monroe 5967

Bid Price Unit 80 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Shocks, Monroe 5969

Bid Price Unit 80 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

ALOHA AUTOMOTIVE | AUTOMOTIVE | CHARLES W. CUTTER HONOLULU PACIFIC PACIFIC
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS WAREHOUSE | CARTER CO. FORD INC. FORD INC. JOBBERS MACHINERY,
DISTRIBUTING | DISTRIBUTOR, INC. HAWAII WAREHOUSE INC.

INC. INC.
$20.72 $52.67 $20.90 $31.16 $65.59 $35.99 $40.11
$828.80 $2,106.80 $836.00 $1,246.40 $2,623.60 $1,439.60 $1,604.40
ARI 62D749 RAY PGD749QS Raybestos Parts Master GM OE Raybestos Performance
BMD 749 MD749 88899570 PGD749M Friction
074920
$30.84 $28.39 $145.13 $41.12 $71.65 NO BID ltems 32 - 35
$925.20 $851.70 $4,353.90 $1,233.60 $2,149.50 NO BID
BCA 513104 TMK 513104 Neopco BCA 513104 Ford OE
F7AZ1104AC
$47.89 $49.90 NO BID $63.85 $59.21 NO BID
$1,436.70 $1,497.00 $1,915.50 $1,776.30
BCA 513202 TMK 513202 BCA 513202 Ford OE
FSAZ1104AA
$18.92 $19.26 $11.69 $22.11 $18.29 $21.99
$1,513.60 $1,540.80 $935.20 $1,768.80 $1,463.20 $1,759.20
Monroe 5967 MON 5967 Gabiriel Monroe 5967 Ford OE Monroe
64635 E7PZ8125A 5967
$20.87 $21.26 $12.01 $24.40 $18.29 $22.99
$1,669.60 $1,700.80 $960.80 $1,952.00 $1,463.20 $1,839.20
Monroe 5969 MON 5969 64635 Monroe 5969 Ford OE Monroe 5969

3U2Z1814AA
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ITEM
NO.
36.

37.

38.

39.

40.

Wiper Blades, Anco 31-16
Bid Price Unit
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Wiper Blades, Anco 31-18
Bid Price Unit
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Wiper Blades, Anco 31019
Bid Price Unit
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Wiper Blades, Anco 31019
Bid Price Unit
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Wiper Blades, Anco 31-22
Bid Price Unit
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

30 each

30 each

30 each

30 each

300 each

ALOHA AUTOMOTIVE | AUTOMOTIVE | CHARLES W. CUTTER HONOLULU PACIFIC PACIFIC
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS WAREHOUSE | CARTER CO. FORD INC. FORD INC. JOBBERS MACHINERY,
DISTRIBUTING | DISTRIBUTOR, INC. HAWAII WAREHOUSE INC.

INC. INC.

$4.28 $4.27| Items 36 - 41 $4.02 |Items 37 - 42 $5.00 $4.89
$128.40 $128.10 NO BID $120.60 NO BID $150.00 $146.70

ANCO 31-16 ANC 31-16 ANCO 31-16 Trico 16-1 Anco 31-16
$4.28 $4.27 $4.02 $5.50 $4.89
$128.40 $128.10 $120.60 $165.00 $146.70

ANCO 31-18 ANC 31-18 ANCO 31-18 Trico 18-1 Anco 31-18
$4.72 $4.71 $4.44 $5.50 $5.41
$141.60 $141.30 $133.20 $165.00 $162.30

ANCO 31-19 ANC 31-19 ANCO 31-19 Trico 19-1 Anco 31-19
$5.25 $5.26 $4.94 $5.59 $6.01
$157.50 $157.80 $148.20 $167.70 $180.30

ANCO 31-20 ANC 31-20 ANCO 31-20 Trico 20-1 Anco 31-20
$5.81 $5.81 $5.47 $6.29 $6.66
$1,743.00 $1,743.00 $1,641.00 $1,887.00 $1,998.00

ANCO 31-22 ANC 31-22 ANCO 31-22 Trico 22-1 Anco 31-22
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ITEM
NO.
41.

42.

43.

44.

45.

Wiper Blades, Anco 31-24

Bid Price Unit 30 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Thermostat, Parts Master 32128

Bid Price Unit 80 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

AC Accumulator, Four Seasons 33093

Bid Price Unit 40 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

AC Air Compressor, Four Seasons 57129
Bid Price
Core Charge Unit 40 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

AC Evaporator Core, Four Seasons 54549
Bid Price Unit 40 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

ALOHA AUTOMOTIVE | AUTOMOTIVE | CHARLES W. CUTTER HONOLULU PACIFIC PACIFIC
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS WAREHOUSE CARTER CO. FORD INC. FORD INC. JOBBERS MACHINERY,
DISTRIBUTING | DISTRIBUTOR, INC. HAWAII WAREHOUSE INC.

INC. INC.
$6.04 $6.04 $5.69 $7.99 $6.92
$181.20 $181.20 $170.70 $239.70 $207.60
ANCO 31-24 ANC 31-24 ANCO 31-24 Trico 24-1 Anco 31-24
$1.99 $3.56 $2.49 $3.68 $4.00| Items 42 - 45
$159.20 $284.80 $199.20 $294.40 $320.00 NO BID
MOTORAD SNT 13868 Stant 32438 Parts Master Stant 13868
240-180 32128
$41.85 $51.04 $43.78 $44.93 $46.23 $41.49
$1,674.00 $2,041.60 $1,751.20 $1,797.20 $1,849.20 $1,659.60
FOUR FOS 33093 Four Seasons Four Seasons Ford OE Four Seasons
SEASONS 208415 33093 |F7AZ196836AA 33093
33093
$278.73
Core $20.00 Core (-$26.00) NO BID Core (-$26.00) |Core (-$36.46)
$134.72 $190.29 $190.29 $242.27 NO BID
$6,188.80 $6,571.60 $6,571.60 $9,690.80
FOUR FOS 57129 Four Seasons Ford OE
SEASONS 57129 |F34719V703
57129 AARM
$97.39 $127.86 $101.86 $127.86 $223.84 $114.49
$3,895.60 $5,114.40 $4,074.40 $5,114.40 $8,953.60 $4,579.60
FOUR FOS 54549 Four Seasons Four Seasons Ford OE Four Seasons
SEASONS 288173 54549 | YW7Z19850DA 54549
54549 Evap Assy &

Case
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ITEM
NO.
46.

47.

48.

49.

50.

AC Oirifice Tube, Four Seasons 38639

Bid Price Unit 40 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

AC Hose, Four Seasons 55719

Bid Price Unit 40 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Fan Clutch, Ford FBAZ8A616AA

Bid Price Unit 6 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Brake Master Cyl, Ford F7TAZ2140DA

Bid Price Unit 24 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Brake Master Cyl, Ford FBAZ2140AA

Bid Price Unit 24 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

ALOHA AUTOMOTIVE | AUTOMOTIVE | CHARLES W. CUTTER HONOLULU PACIFIC PACIFIC
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS WAREHOUSE | CARTER CO. FORD INC. FORD INC. JOBBERS MACHINERY,
DISTRIBUTING | DISTRIBUTOR, INC. HAWAII WAREHOUSE INC.

INC. INC.
$2.59 $3.76 $2.72 $3.76 $1.70 $3.76 $2.53
$103.60 $150.40 $108.80 $150.40 $68.00 $150.40 $101.20
FOUR FOS 38639 Four Seasons Four Seasons Ford OE Four Seasons Bergstrom
SEASONS 207319 38639 F5Dz 38639 /2GG162142
38639 19D990AB
$19.36 $21.73 $20.25 $21.73 $18.50 $19.99| Items 47 - 67
$774.40 $869.20 $810.00 $869.20 $740.00 $799.60 NO BID
FOUR FOS 55719 Four Seasons Four Seasons Ford OE Four Seasons
SEASONS 200925 (55719 F5VY19835A 55719
55719
Iltems 48 - 67 Iltems 48 - 67 Items 48 - 53
ALL NO BID ALL NO BID NO BID NO BID $63.40 $74.58 NO BID
$380.40 $447.48
Ford
NO BID $181.79 $197.60 $110.99
$4,362.96 $4,742.40 $2,663.76
Ford Raybestos
MC390460
$125.15 $120.88 $131.39 $72.99
$3,003.60 $2,901.12 $3,153.36 $1,751.76
Wagner Ford Raybestos
MC134464 MC390569
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ITEM
NO.
51.

52.

53.

54.

55.

Blower Resistor, Ford E3AZ19A706A

Bid Price Unit
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Bearing, Ford FADZ3517A
Bid Price Unit

Total
Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Bearing, Ford FADZ3517C
Bid Price Unit

Total
Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

02 Sensor, Ford F5SMZ9F472B
Bid Price Unit

Total
Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

6 each

30 each

30 each

50 each

DPFE Sensor, Ford F6FZ9J460AA

Bid Price Unit
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

50 each

ALOHA AUTOMOTIVE | AUTOMOTIVE | CHARLES W. CUTTER HONOLULU PACIFIC PACIFIC
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS WAREHOUSE | CARTER CO. FORD INC. FORD INC. JOBBERS MACHINERY,
DISTRIBUTING | DISTRIBUTOR, INC. HAWAII WAREHOUSE INC.

INC. INC.
Items 51 - 53
NO BID $12.05 $13.10 NO BID
$72.30 $78.60
Ford
$4.21 $4.57 NO BID
$126.30 $137.10
Ford
$9.76 $5.09 NO BID
$292.80 $152.70
Ford
$29.94 $33.45 $63.13 $74.27 $45.99
$1,497.00 $1,672.50 $3,156.50 $3,713.50 $2,299.50
Standard Standard Ford Bosch 13133
SG177 SG177
NO BID NO BID $58.15 $63.21 NO BID
$2,907.50 $3,160.50
Frod
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ITEM
NO.
56.

57.

58.

59.

60.

02 Sensor, Ford F6DZ9G444B

Bid Price Unit 50 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

EGR Valve, Ford XL3Z9D475BA

Bid Price Unit 50 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

EGR Solenoid, Ford F63Z9J459AA

Bid Price Unit 50 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Lug Nut, Ford FBAZ1012AA

Bid Price Unit 250 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Wheel Center Cap, Ford F8721130GB

Bid Price Unit 60 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

ALOHA AUTOMOTIVE | AUTOMOTIVE | CHARLES W. CUTTER HONOLULU PACIFIC PACIFIC
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS WAREHOUSE | CARTER CO. FORD INC. FORD INC. JOBBERS MACHINERY,
DISTRIBUTING | DISTRIBUTOR, INC. HAWAII WAREHOUSE INC.

INC. INC.
$45.32 $48.14 $54.03 $58.73 $35.00
$2,266.00 $2,407.00 $2,701.50 $2,936.50 $1,750.00
Beck Arnley Standard Ford Bosch 15717
156-4004 SG145
$35.86 $41.27 $29.24 $34.41 $39.99
$1,793.00 $2,063.50 $1,462.00 $1,720.50 $1,999.50
Standard Standard Ford Standard
EGV 464 EGV464 Motors
EGV464
Items 58 - 67
Iltems 58 - 67 Iltems 58 - 67 $18.47 $20.08
NO BID NO BID $923.50 $1,004.00
Ford
$1.65 $1.78
$412.50 $445.00
Ford
$16.31 $17.74
$978.60 $1,064.40
Ford
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ITEM
NO.
61.

62.

63.

64.

65.

Hood Support, Ford FBA16C826AA

Bid Price Unit 30 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Rim, Ford F5AZ1007A

Bid Price Unit 24 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Rim, Ford FBAZ1007EA

Bid Price Unit 24 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Handle, Ford FBAZ5461199AA

Bid Price Unit 24 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Exhaust Insulator, Ford F6VZ5A242AA
Bid Price Unit 20 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

ALOHA AUTOMOTIVE | AUTOMOTIVE | CHARLES W. CUTTER HONOLULU PACIFIC PACIFIC
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS WAREHOUSE | CARTER CO. FORD INC. FORD INC. JOBBERS MACHINERY,
DISTRIBUTING | DISTRIBUTOR, INC. HAWAII WAREHOUSE INC.

INC. INC.
$17.40 $18.91
$522.00 $567.30

Ford
$75.07 $81.60
$1,801.68 $1,958.40
Ford
$95.85 $104.20
$2,300.40 $2,500.80
Ford
$4.73 $5.15
$113.52 $123.60
Ford
$4.24 $4.61
$84.80 $92.20
Ford
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ITEM
NO.
66.

67.

Engine Mount, Ford F4AZ6038A

Bid Price Unit 30 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

Engine Mount, Ford F4AZ6038B

Bid Price Unit 30 each
Total

Manufacturer's brand & part no.:

ALOHA AUTOMOTIVE | AUTOMOTIVE | CHARLES W. CUTTER HONOLULU PACIFIC PACIFIC
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS WAREHOUSE | CARTER CO. FORD INC. FORD INC. JOBBERS MACHINERY,
DISTRIBUTING | DISTRIBUTOR, INC. HAWAII WAREHOUSE INC.

INC. INC.
$44.70 $48.58
$1,341.00 $1,457.40
Ford
$47.25 $51.35
$1,417.50 $1,540.50
Ford




