ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR
DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET AND FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
PROPOSAL NO. 14295
OPENED: FEBRUARY 9, 2004

For the furnishing and delivery of PNEUMATIC BFS RETAIL & EAST BAY TIRE CO. THE GOODYEAR TIRE NATIONAL SOUTH SEAS CYCLE

TIRES AND TUBES for the twelve-month period COMMERCIAL & RUBBER COMPANY INDUSTRIAL TIRE EXCHANGE, INC.

beginning April-1, 2004 and ending March-31, OPERATIONS HAWAII OF HAWAII

2005 to the City and County of Honolulu TIRE WHOLESALE

ITEM
PART 1 - UNMOUNTED TIRES
. MOTORCYCLE TIRES
. 120/70ZR17 Tubeless Radial for BMW Motorcycle,

Dunlap 9900001122. NO SUBSTITUTE. Dunlap D204 #325775

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: BMW 99000001122

Bid Price: Unit 175 est. qty. NOBID1-4 NOBID1-4 NOBID1-5 NOBID1-44 $108.32
Total $18,956.00

Stock or Import:
. 160/60ZR18 Tubeless Radial for BMW Motorcycle,
Dunlap Sportman. NO SUBSTITUTE.

Dunlap D204 #325752

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: BMW 99000001123
Bid Price: Unit 175 est. qty. $126.66
Total $22,165.50

Stock or Import:
. 120/70ZR17 Tubeless Radial for BMW Motorcycle,
Dunlap D205F. NO SUBSTITUTE.

Dunlap D205F #7652093

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: BMW 99990000511
Bid Price: Unit 175 est. qty. $143.33
Total $25,082.75

Stock or Import:

. 170/60ZR17 Tubeless Radial for BMW Motorcycle,

Dunlap D205g. NO SUBSTITUTE.

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 175 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

. PASSENGER CAR TIRES

. P165/80R13, SBR

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 36 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

FS 097659 380
$21.25

$765.00

I

GT, CHAMPIRO, A244
$21.35

$768.60

S

Dunlap D205G #3335379
BMW 99990000512
$154.99

$27,123.25

I

NO BID 5 - 134
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6. P175/70R13, SBR

10.

11.

12.

13.

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 45 est. qty.
Total
Stock or Import:

P175/80R13

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 85 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

P185/80R13, SBR

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 27 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

P175/70R14, SBR

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 30 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

P185/70R14, SBR

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 9 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

P185/75R14, SBR, black wall (on at least one side)

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 28 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

P185/75R14, SBR, white wall

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 54 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

P195/75R14, SBR, white wall

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 10 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

FS 097705 380
$23.75
$1,068.75

I

FS 097756 380
$22.95
$1,950.75

I

FS 097969 380
$24.50
$661.50

I

FS 097713 380
$25.25
$757.50

I

FS 097845 380
$26.75
$240.75

I

FS 0979742 380
$25.50

$714.00

I

FS 097942 380
$25.50
$1,377.00

I

FS 098000 380
$26.75
$267.50

GT, CLASSIRO, A684
$21.87

$984.15

S

GT CHAMPIRO, A245
$23.44

$1,992.40

S

NO BID

GT, CLASSIRO, A700
$22.92

$687.60

S

GT, CLASSIRO, A682
$26.56

$239.04

S

GT, CHAMPIRO, A260
$26.30

$736.40

S

GT, CHAMPIRO, A260
$26.30

$1,420.20

S

GT, CHAMPIRO, A261
$28.12
$281.20

S

402-136-477 Integrity
$25.93

$1,166.85

Stock

NOBID7 &8

402-268-047 Integrity|
$27.77

$833.10

Stock

402-102-477 Integrity|
$28.74

$258.66

Stock

402-853-436 Integrity|
$28.98

$811.44

Stock

402-853-436 Integrity|
$28.98

$1,564.92

Stock

402-645-436 Integrity|
$29.99

$299.90

Stock
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14. P205/70R14, SBR, white wall

15.

16.

17.

18.

19.

20.

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:
Bid Price: Unit
Total
Stock or Import:
P205/75R14, SBR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:
Bid Price: Unit
Total
Stock or Import:
P215/70R14, SBR, white wall
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:
Bid Price: Unit
Total
Stock or Import:
P215/75R14, SBR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:
Bid Price: Unit
Total
Stock or Import:
P195/75R15, SBR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:
Bid Price: Unit
Total
Stock or Import:
P205/65R15, SBR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:
Bid Price: Unit
Total
Stock or Import:
P215/60R15, SBR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.
Bid Price: Unit
Total
Stock or Import:

30 est.

97 est.

25 est.

20 est.

4 est.

34 est.

18 est.

qty.

qty.

qty.

qty.

qty.

qty.

qty.

FS 098027 380
$34.50
$1,035.00

I

FS 098043 380
$28.50
$2,764.50

I

FS 098078 380
$36.50
$912.50

I

FS 098167 380
$34.00
$680.00

I

NO BID

FS 098019 380
$33.25
$1,130.50

I

NANCO 24-265 601
$37.95

$683.10

I

GT, CLASSIRO, A688
$31.77

$953.10

S

GT, CHAMPIRO, A262
$31.46

$3,051.62

S

NO BID 16 - 18

GT, CHAMPIRO, A385
$35.67

$1,212.78

S

GT, GTX-60, A376
$37.50

$675.00

S

402-211-436 Integrity|
$32.10

$963.00

Stock

402-728-436 Integrity|
$29.75

$2,885.75

Stock

402-359-436 Integrity|
$33.21

$830.25

Stock

402-434-436 Integrity|
$32.10

$642.00

Stock

773-425-415 Wrangler ST
$54.43

$217.72

Stock

402-406-477 Integrity|
$35.49

$1,206.66

Stock

100-430-200 Eagle GT HR
$49.26

$886.68

Stock
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21. P215/65HR15, high speed police tire, tubeless,

22.

23.

24.

25.

26.

27.

SBR, special radial ply design, speed rated at

130-MPH.

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 24 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

P215/65R15, SBR

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 3 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

P205/70R15, SBR

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 48 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

P205/75R15, SBR

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 76 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

P205/75R15, SBR, white wall

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 65 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

P215/75R15, SBR, white wall

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 103 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

P215/75R15, SBR, black wall on both sides of tire

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.

Bid Price: Unit 60 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

NANCO 24-545 601
$38.75

$930.00

I

NANCO 24545 601
$38.75

$116.25

I

FS 098035 380
$31.15
$1,495.20

I

FS 098051 380
$29.75
$2,261.00

I

FS 098051 380
$29.75
$1,933.75

I

FS 098329 380

$31.00
$3,193.00

NO BID 27 & 28

GT, CHAMPIRO, A382
$29.95

$718.80

S

GT, CHAMPIRO, A382
$35.67

$107.01

S

GT, CLASSIRO, A693
$32.81

$1,574.88

S

GT, CHAMPIRO, A263
$31.04

$2,359.04

S

GT, CHAMPIRO, A263
$31.04

$2,017.60

S

GT CHAPIRO, A264
$32.08

$3,304.24

S

NO BID

104-186-449 Eagle GT+4
$50.41

$1,209.84

Stock

187-008-016 Regatta 2
$46.53

$139.59

Stock

402-117-436 Integrity|
$35.76

$1,716.48

Stock

402-705-436 Integrity|
$34.55

$2,625.80

Stock

402-705-436 Integrity|
$34.55

$2,245.75

Stock

402-391-436 Integrity|
$32.25

$3,321.75

Stock

NO BID
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28. P225/70HR15, high speed police tire, tubeless,

29.

30.

31.

32.

special radial ply design, speed rated at 130-MPH,

"Goodyear Eagle GT or GT+4", "B.F. Goodrich Euro

T/A" or "General Tire XP2000H or XP2000ASH". NO

SUBSTITUTE. Contractor must stock at least 20

tires for HPD emergency purchases during the first

11 months of the contract regardless of whether

bidding "Stock" or "Import".

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 252 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

P225/70R15, SBR, white wall

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 68 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

P235/70HR15, high speed police tire, tubeless,

special radial ply design, speed rated at 130-MPH,

"Goodyear Eagle GT or GT+4", "B.F. Goodrich Euro

T/A" or "General Tire XP2000H or XP2000ASH". NO

SUBSTITUTE. Contractor must stock at least 10

tires for HPD emergency purchases during the first

11 months of the contract regardless of whether

bidding "Stock" or "Import".

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 204 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

P225/75R15, SBR, white wall

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.

Bid Price: Unit 131 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

P235/75R15, SBR, white wall

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 109 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

FS 005525 440
$40.50
$2,754.00

I

NO BID

FS 098353 380
$32.50
$4,257.50

I

FS 098361 380
$33.25
$3,624.25

I

GEN, XP2000AS,
15440490000
$57.29
$14,437.08

S

NO BID 29 & 30

GT, CHAMPIRO, A265
$34.89

$4,570.59

S

GT, CHAMPIRO, A266
$37.13

$4,047.17

S

*GT+4 discontinued in
this size.

*732-478-500 Eagle RS-A
$48.00

$12,096.00

Stock

402-392-436 Integrity|
$38.30

$2,604.40

Stock

*GT+4 & Eagle GT
discontinued
*732-807-500 Eagle RS-A
$45.00

$9,180.00

Stock

402-692-436 Integrity|
$37.02

$4,849.62

Stock

187-019-026 Regatta 2
$48.43

$5,278.87

Stock
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33. P215/60R16
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No. FS 096326 440 187-009-016 Regatta 2
Bid Price: Unit 20 est. qty. $41.75 NO BID 33 & 34 $51.56
Total $835.00 $1,031.20
Stock or Import: [ Stock
34. P215/70R16, black wall on both sides of tire
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No. 403-207-174 Wrangler HP
Bid Price: Unit 16 est. qty. NO BID $92.24
Total $1,475.84
Stock or Import: Stock

35.

36.

37.

38.

P225/60R16, tubeless, special radial ply design,

speed rated to 130 mph

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 300 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

lll. TRUCK TIRES

A. Tube Type, Bias, On-Highway Only, All-Position Only

31X10.50R15LT, steel/polyester belted, all terrain,

"B.F. Goodrich Radial All-Terrain T/A" or "General

Tire Grabber AT", or equivalent

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 4 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

32X11.50R15LT, steel/polyester belted, all terrain,

"B.F. Goodrich Radial All-Terrain T/A" or "General

Tire Grabber AT", or equivalent

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 2 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

8.25 X 15, 14 PR

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 6 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

NANCO 24-665 601
$42.25

$12,675.00

I

NO BID 36 & 37

NANCO 22400
$90.00
$540.00

I

GT, PRECIRO, A747
$46.87

$14,061.00

S

NO BID 36 & 37

TRIANGLE, 1502
$87.49

$524.94

S

100-392-200 Eagle GT HR
$42.75

$12,825.00

Stock

NO BID 36 - 41
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39.9.00 X 20, 10 PR

40.

41.

42.

43.

44.

45.

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 10 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

10.00 X 20, 12 PR

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 38 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

11.00 X 20, 14 PR, Highway Tread

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 38 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

B. Tubeless, Bias, On-Highway Only, All-Position Only

8 X 145,12 PR

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 22 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

LT235-75R15, 8 PR, SBR, all terrain

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 18 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

7.50 X 16, 10 PR

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 30 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

LT215/85R16, 8 PR, SBR

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 218 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

NANCO 21-415
$95.00
$950.00

I

NANCO 21-201
$112.50
$4,275.00

I

NANCO 21-305F
$156.00
$5,928.00

I

NANCO 22-516
$49.25
$1,083.50

I

NO BID

NANCO 22-4622
$55.00
$1,650.00

I

NANCO 22-860
$60.00
$13,080.00

I

NO BID 39 - 41

DURO, HF-501,
375011409
$53.12
$1,168.64

S

GT, SAVERO, A489
$60.41
$1,087.38

S

NO BID

GT ADVENTURO TL
CGT9048

$58.33

$12,715.94

S

141-678-320 Trac HM
$122.61

$2,697.42

Stock

411-828-478 Wrangler AT/S
$83.00

$1,494.00

Stock

312-100-090 Workhorse
$73.99

$2,219.70

Stock

796-268-195 Conquest AP
$62.21

$13,561.78

Stock

Advance XT #15524
$69.50

$15,151.00

STK
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46. LT215-85R16, 10 PR, SBR, (black wall on both

47.

48.

49.

sides of tire) 2680 Ib. load, dual 2470 Ib. load.

Contractor must stock at least 10 tires for Honolulu

Emergency Services Department emergency

purchases during the first 11 months of the

contract regardless of whether bidding "Stock" or

"Import"

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 75 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

LT215-85R16, SBR, (black wall on both sides of

tire), all position, highway, commercial light truck,

all steel casing, designed for multiple retreading.

Goodyear G-159 LT, Bridgestone Metro Radial

R187 All Steel, or equivalent. Contractor must stock

at least 60 tires for Oahu Transit Services

emergency purchases and at least 20 tires for

Honolulu Emergency Services Department

emergency purchases during the first 11-months of

the contract regardless of whether bidding "Stock"

or "Import"

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 1,002 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

LT225-75R16, 8 PR, SBR

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 177 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

8.75R16.5, 10 PR, SBR

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 4 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

NANCO 22-862
$64.00
$4,800.00

S

BS R-187 295-175
$86.50
$86,673.00

S

NANCO 22-765
$60.50
$10,708.50

I

FS 281-840
$60.00
$240.00

I

NO BID 46 & 47

GT, SAVERO A579
$52.20

$9,239.40

S

DURO, HF504, 365061656
$59.89

$239.56

S

139-821-359 G159
$93.00

$6,975.00

Stock

139-821-359 G159
$93.00
$93,186.00

Stock

796-943-195 Conquest AP
$66.78

$11,820.06

Stock

139-357-359 G159
$132.35
$529.40

Stock

Chaparral Comm. Hwy
#11624

$76.30

$5,722.50
STK

NO BID

Chaparral Comm. Hwy.
#11626
$74.11

$13,117.47
STK

NO BID 49 & 50
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50. 9.50R16.5, 10 PR, SBR

51.

52.

53.

54.

55

56.

57.

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:
Bid Price: Unit

Total
Stock or Import:
LT235-85R16, 10 PR, SBR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:
Bid Price: Unit

Total
Stock or Import:
LT245/75R16, 10 PR, SBR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:
Bid Price: Unit

Total
Stock or Import:
LT265/75R16, 6 PR, SBR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:
Bid Price: Unit

Total
Stock or Import:
8.00 X 16.5, 8 PR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:
Bid Price: Unit

Total
Stock or Import:
8.75 X 16.5, 8PR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:
Bid Price: Unit

Total
Stock or Import:
9.50 X 16.5LT, 10 PR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:
Bid Price: Unit

Total
Stock or Import:
12 X 16.5LT, 12 PR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:
Bid Price: Unit

Total
Stock or Import:

32 est.

166 est.

362 est.

20 est.

8 est.

6 est.

22 est.

18 est.

qty.

qty.

qty.

qty.

qty.

qty.

qty.

qty.

FS 281-859
$72.80
$2,329.60

I

NANCO 22-870
$64.50
$10,707.00

I

NANCO 22-775
$66.00
$23,892.00

I

NANCO 22-277
$90.00
$1,800.00

I

NO BID

N 22-072

$55.00
$330.00
I

22-067
$64.00
$1,408.00
I

NO BID

DURO, HF506, 365061661
$79.16

$2,533.12

S

GT, SAVERO, A626
$66.66

$11,065.56

S

GT, SAVERO, A580
$66.66

$24,130.92

S

GT, SAVERO, A628
$65.62

$1,312.40

S

STA, SUPTRANS, LA4AS5
$63.54

$508.32

S
DURO, HF-504,
365041655
$56.25
$337.50

S
DURO, HF-506,
365061661
$66.66
$1,466.52

S

STA, SUPTRANS, LA4EL
$120.83

$2,174.94

S

NO BID

796-045-078 Conquest AP
$73.29

$12,166.14

Stock

753-429-102 Conquest AT
$78.95

$28,579.90

Stock

753-898-103 Conquest AT
$80.22

$1,604.40

Stock

NO BID 54 & 55

312-218-090 Workhorse
$82.38

$1,812.36

Stock

180-854-675 Custom Hi Miler
$233.03

$4,194.54

Stock

Chaparral Comm. Hwy.
#11631
$83.20

$13,811.20
STK

Chaparrel Hwy #11632
$90.50

$32,761.00

STK

NO BID 53 - 61
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58. 215/75R17.5, 16 PR, Goodyear Unisteel G114 or

59.

60.

61.

62.

63.

comparable SBR, Trailer service.

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 8 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

LT225/70R19.5, 12 PR, SBR

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 8 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

LT245/70R19.5, 14PR, Goodyear Unisteel G159 or

comparable, SBR, all position rib tire

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.

Bid Price: Unit 4 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

LT245/70R19.5, 14PR, Goodyear Unisteel G124 or

comparable, SBR, drive wheel tire

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.

Bid Price: Unit 8 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

315/80R22.5, 20 PR, Low Profile. Contractor must

stock at least 30 tires for the Division of Refuse

Collection and Disposal for emergency purchases

during the first 11 months of the contract

regardless of whether bidding "Stock" or "Import"

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 642 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

385/65R22.5, 18 PR, Goodyear Unisteel G286 or

application, on/off comparable, SBR, all position,

severe service highway, resistant to chunking and

rib tear.

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 19 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

BS 264695

$150.00
$1,200.00
I

FS 160 716 560 New
$190.00

$1,520.00

I

FS 169 964 560 New
$220.00
$880.00

I

BS 281-107 M724
$176.00
$1,408.00

I

FS 160597
$250.00
$160,500.00
S

FS 294586 T-839
$285.00
$5,415.00

CONTI, HTR RIB, 0210846
$172.91

$1,383.28

S

GEN, LMT400, 0159948
$182.28

$1,458.24

S

NO BID 60 & 61

CONTI, HMS 45+, 0207004
$257.28

$165,173.76

S

CONTI, HTR, 0206040
$391.64

$7,441.16

S

756-246-567 G114
$129.56
$1,036.48

Stock

139-418-053 G647 RSS
$177.89

$1,423.12

Stock

139-913-972 G159
$207.68
$830.72

Stock

139-913-774 G124
$198.28
$1,586.24

Stock

756-256-420 G291
$260.00
$166,920.00
Stock

759-550-541 G286
$311.15
$5,911.85

Stock

LING LONG #LLFO06
$273.89
$175,837.38

STK

NO BID 63 - 66
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64. 425/65R22.5, 20PR, Goodyear Unisteel G286 or

65.

66.

67.

68.

comparable, on/off comparable, SBR, all position,
severe service highway, resistant to chunking and
rib tear.

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 10 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

9R22.5,12 PR

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 6 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

10R22.5, 12 PR

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 14 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

11R22.5, 16 PR, Goodyear Unisteel G159 or

comparable, SBR, all position rib tire. Contractor

must stock at least 40 tires for the Division of

Refuse Collection and Disposal for emergency

purchases during the first 11 months of the

contract regardless of whether bidding "Stock" or

"Import"

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 1,099 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

11R22.5-H, 16 PR, Goodyear Unisteel G167 or

comparable, SBR, drive wheel tire. Contractor

must stock at least 20 tires for the Division of

Refuse Collection and Disposal for emergency

purchases during the first 11 months of the

contract regardless of whether bidding "Stock" or

"Import"

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 22 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

FS 294594

$335.00
$3,350.00
I

FS 290467 559
$150.00
$900.00

I

FS 290 475 T559
$179.00
$2,506.00

I

FS 290 505 T-559
$172.00
$189,028.00

S

BS 283681 M711
$210.00
$4,620.00

S

CONTI, HTR, 0206067
$396.85

$3,968.50

S

GEN, S360, 0111422
$163.53
$981.18

S

GEN, AMSTL, 0237329
$221.86

$3,106.04

S

GEN, AMSTL, 0237612
$167.70

$184,302.30

S

GEN, D450, 0236916
$229.15
$5,041.30

S

759-452-541 G286
$347.61
$3,476.10

Stock

138-743-903 G159
$152.71
$916.26

Stock

138-769-903 G159
$185.72
$2,600.08

Stock

138-803-903 G159
$195.09
$214,403.91
Stock

138-803-237 G167
$228.55
$5,028.10

Stock]

Long March #LM110
$197.11
$216,623.89

STK

NO BID 68 - 86
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EAST BAY TIRE CO.

THE GOODYEAR TIRE
& RUBBER COMPANY

NATIONAL
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OF HAWAII

69. 12R22.5, Goodyear Unisteel G286 or comparable.
SBR, all position, severe service application, on/off

70.

71.

72.

73.

74.

highway, resistant to chunking and rib tear.

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 24 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

12R24.5,16 PR, Goodyear Unisteel G286 or

comparable, SBR, all position, severe service

resistant to chunking and rib tear.

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 8 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

IV. FARM TRACTOR TIRES

7.50 X 16 (F2), 6 PR, Rib Traction

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 18 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

11.00 X 16, 12 PR, F3, Rib

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 4 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

11L X 16, (TU F3), 12 PR

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 8 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

23 X 10.50 X 12, 4 PR, Tubeless, Turf and Field, G2

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 17 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

FS 157341

$243.00
$5,832.00

FS 157368 T819

$297.00
$2,376.00

NANCO 26400

$46.00
$828.00

FS 340537

$130.00
$520.00

FS 326089 IndF-3

$101.00
$808.00

NANCO 26-176

$37.50
$637.50

CONTI, HSC, 0238473
$230.19

$5,524.56

S

NO BID

CAMBRIDGE, 306
$47.91

$862.38

S

TITAN, F-3, 464396
$134.37
$537.48

S

SOLIDEAL, IMP, 10311160
$89.58

$716.64

S

TITN, TURF R/S TL, 475367
$36.46

$619.82

S

138-864-554 G286
$268.24
$6,437.76

Stock

138-869-554 G286
$274.69
$2,197.52

Stock

162-189-404 Tri Rib
$47.48

$854.64

Stock

170-273-232 Multi Rib
$152.50
$610.00

Stock

160-550-116 Laborer
$89.75

$718.00

Stock

NO BID
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75. 16.9 X 24, AT UTIL, 8 PR, Tubeless (without

76.

77.

78.

79.

80.

disposal)
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 4 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

Cost to Dispose of City Tire

Bid Price: Unit 4 est. qty.
Total

Total Bid Price (Item No. 75 Plus Item No. 76):

17.5L X 24, 10 PR (without disposal)
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 3 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

Cost to Dispose of City Tire

Bid Price: Unit 3 est. qty.
Total

Total Bid Price (Item No. 77 Plus Item No. 78):

16.9 X 28, Grip Tread, 8 PR, (without disposal)
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 2 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

Cost to Dispose of City Tire

Bid Price: Unit 2 est. qty.
Total

Total Bid Price (Item No. 79 Plus Item No. 80):

NANCO 20-284L
$202.50
$810.00

I

$50.00
$200.00

$1,010.00

FS 325-880 R-4 AT]
$290.00
$870.00

I

$40.00
$120.00

$990.00
FS 354813
$269.00
$538.00
I

$40.00
$80.00

$618.00

SOLIDEAL, R4, 10411215
$209.36
$837.44

S

$40.00
$160.00

$997.44

SOLIDEAL, R4, 10411240
$240.61
$721.83

S

$40.00
$120.00

$841.83
SOLIDEAL, R4, 10411275
$235.40
$470.80
S

$40.00
$80.00

$550.80

165-721-314 1T525
$242.40
$969.60

Import

$40.00
$160.00

$1,129.60

165-756-314 IT525
$260.72
$782.16

Stock

$40.00
$120.00

$902.16

165-737-314 1T525
$248.51
$497.02

Import

$40.00
$80.00

$577.02
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81. 16.9 X 28, Grip Tread, Tubeless, 10 PR, (without

82.

83.

84.

85.

86.

disposal)
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.

Bid Price: Unit 6 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

Cost to Dispose of City Tire

Bid Price: Unit 6 est. qty.
Total

Total Bid Price (Item No. 81 Plus Item No. 82):

V. ROAD GRADER TIRES, TUBE TYPE, NYLON CORD

12.5/80 X 18-E, Sure Grip 10 PR (without disposal)
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 4 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

Cost to Dispose of City Tire

Bid Price: Unit 4 est. qty.
Total

Total Bid Price (Item No. 83 Plus Item No. 84):

VI. LOADER-DOZER, LOADER, PAVER,
TUBELESS, NYLON CORD

10 X 16.5NHS-C, 6 PR (without disposal)
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 16 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

Cost to Dispose of City Tire

Bid Price: Unit 16 est. qty.
Total

Total Bid Price (Item No. 85 Plus Item No. 86):

FS 355275

$290.00
$1,740.00
I

$40.00
$240.00

$1,980.00

FS 359912 I-3
$200.00
$800.00

I

$10.00
$40.00

$840.00

NANCO 20-731
$67.95
$1,087.20

I

$8.00
$128.00

$1,215.20

SOLIDEAL, R4, 10411275
$234.36

$1,406.16

S

$40.00
$240.00

$1,646.16

SOLIDEAL, SG, 10411205
$178.11
$712.44

S

$10.00
$40.00

$752.44

SOLIDEAL, SKS, 10411144
$52.08

$833.28

S

$6.00
$96.00

$929.28

165-739-314 1T525
$268.45
$1,610.70

Import

$40.00
$240.00

$1,850.70

170-604-113 SG Lug
$206.75
$827.00

Import

$10.00
$40.00

$867.00

202-201-400 SGL SS
$86.32

$1,381.12

Stock

$8.00
$128.00

$1,509.12
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87. 17.5 X 25-F, L2, Directional 12 PR (without disposal) Gen Grader Il (L-2/G-2)
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: FS 425-129 SOLIDEAL, L2, 10411410, 123-897-458 SGLDL2A #293714
Bid Price: Unit 8 est. qty. $375.00 $323.94 $445.20 $385.00
Total $3,000.00 $2,591.52 $3,561.60 $3,080.00
Stock or Import: [ S Stock STK
88. Cost to Dispose of City Tire
Bid Price: Unit 8 est. qty. $65.00 $50.00 $60.00 $63.00
Total $520.00 $400.00 $480.00 $504.00
Total Bid Price (Item No. 87 Plus Item No. 88): $3,520.00 $2,991.52 $4,041.60 $3,584.00
89. 17.5 X 25, L3, Non Directional, 12 PR, (without
disposal)
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: FS 405892 SOLIDEAL, L3, 10411410R  123-897-175 HRLDL3A Gen. L-3 #271373
Bid Price: Unit 8 est. qty. $390.00 $391.64 $506.80 $407.26
Total $3,120.00 $3,133.12 $4,054.40 $3,258.08
Stock or Import: [ S Stock STK
90. Cost to Dispose of City Tire
Bid Price: Unit 8 est. qty. $65.00 $50.00 $60.00 $60.00
Total $520.00 $400.00 $480.00 $480.00
Total Bid Price (Item No. 89 Plus Item No. 90): $3,640.00 $3,5633.12 $4,534.40 $3,738.08
91. 23.5 X 25, L4, 20 PR (without disposal) Gen. LD150CRHB
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: FS 416193 GEN, LD1150L4, 0202742 133-909-560 #202742
Bid Price: Unit 18 est. qty. $1,295.00 $1,390.54 $1,258.60 $1,322.83
Total $23,310.00 $25,029.72 $22,654.80 $23,810.94
Stock or Import: I S Import STK
92. Cost to Dispose of City Tire
Bid Price: Unit 18 est. qty. $90.00 $80.00 $100.00 $90.00
Total $1,620.00 $1,440.00 $1,800.00 $1,620.00
Total Bid Price (Item No. 91 Plus Item No. 92): $24,930.00 $26,469.72 $24,454.80 $25,430.94
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93. 23.5 X 25, L5 Slicks, 20 PR (without disposal)
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 4 est. qty.
Total
Stock or Import:
94. Cost to Dispose of City Tire
Bid Price: Unit 4 est. qty.

Total
Total Bid Price (Item No. 93 Plus Item No. 94):
95. 18.4 X 28, Industrial Sure Grip, Tube

Type, 12 PR (without disposal)
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 2 est. qty.
Total
Stock or Import:
96. Cost to Dispose of City Tire
Bid Price: Unit 2 est. qty.

Total
Total Bid Price (Item No. 95 Plus Item No. 96):

VII. LAWN AND GARDEN TIRES

97. 480/400-8, Tube Type, Stud Tread, designed for

long wearing traction, 4 PR

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 12 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

98. 11 x 400-5, Terra, Tubeless, Lawn Mower, Softrac,

Multi-Trac or Turf Bar type tread; designed to

minimize turf damage, 4 PR

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 12 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:

FS 417068
$1,840.00
$7,360.00
I

$90.00
$360.00

$7,720.00

FS 355410

$525.00
$1,050.00
I

$90.00
$180.00

$1,230.00

NANCO 27-426
$12.00
$144.00

I

NANCO 27712
$12.00
$144.00

I

GEN, LD250 L5S, 203552
$1,875.92
$7,503.68

S

$90.00
$360.00

$7,863.68

SOLIDEAL, R4, 10411290
$339.56
$679.12

S

$40.00
$80.00

$759.12

NO BID 97 & 98

NO BID 93 & 94

165-782-034 IND SG
$397.86
$795.72

Import

$60.00
$120.00

$915.72

NO BID 97 - 104

Gen. LD250 Sup.
Smooth #203552
$1,891.45
$7,565.80

STK

$90.00
$360.00

$7,925.80

NO BID 95 - 134
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99. 16 X 650-8, Terra, Tubeless, lawn mower, softrac,
multi-trac, or turf bar type tread; designed to
minimize turf damage, 4 PR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 14 est. qty.
Total
Stock or Import:

100.16 X 750-8, Terra, Tubeless, Studded (Diamond)
Tread, for Turf and Industrial Applications, 4 PR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 18 est. qty.
Total
Stock or Import:

101.16 X 750-8, Terra, Tubeless, Lawn Mower, Softrac,
Multi-Trac, or Turf Bar Type Tread, designed to
Minimize Turf Damage, 4 PR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 54 est. qty.
Total

102.18 X 850-8, Terra, Tubeless, Softrac, Multi-Trac, or
Turf Bar Type Tread, designed to Minimize Turf
Damage, 4 PR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 63 est. qty.
Total

103.18 X 850-8, Terra, Tubeless, Studded (Diamond)
Tread; for Turf and Industrial Applications, 4 PR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 2 est. qty.
Total

104.18 X 950-8, Terra Tubeless, Softrac, Multi-Trac, or
Turf Bar Type Tread; Designed to Minimize Turf
Damage, 4 PR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 29 est. qty.
Total
Stock or Import:

NANCO 27-332

$15.00
$210.00

NO BID

NANCO 27-312

$21.00
$1,134.00

NANCO 27-280

$20.00
$1,260.00

NO BID

NANCO 27-160

$21.00
$609.00

DURO, HF236, 372360816
$14.58

$204.12

S

TITAN, MULTI-TRAC, 474349

$26.04
$468.72
S

TITAN, MULTI-TRAC, 474349
$25.00
$1,350.00

DURO, HF224, 372240821
$18.75
$1,181.25

DURO, HF224, 372240821
$18.75
$37.50

DURO, HF-236S, 372360826
$18.75

$543.75

S
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105.20 X 800-10, Industrial, Terra, Tubeless, Softrac,
Multi-Trac, or Turf Bar Type Tread; Designed to
Minimize Turf Damage, 4 PR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 21 est. qty.
Total
Stock or Import:

106.23 X 8.50-12, Terra, Tubeless, Softrac, Multi-Trac, or

Turf Bar Type Tread; Designed to Minimize Turf

Damage, 4 PR

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Bid Price: Unit 30 est. qty.
Total

Stock or Import:
107.31 X 13.50 x 15NHS-B, Softrac, 4 PR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:
Bid Price: Unit 22 est. qty.
Total
Stock or Import:

VIll. INDUSTRIAL TIRES
108.480/400-8, Industrial, Tubeless, Rib Tread, 4 PR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.
Bid Price: Unit 10 est. qty.
Total
Stock or Import:
109.6.50 X 9, Industrial, Tube Type, Lug Tread, 10 PR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.
Bid Price: Unit 18 est. qty.
Total
Stock or Import:
110.6.50 X 10, Industrial (Forklift), Tube Type, Lug
Tread, 10 PR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.
Bid Price: Unit 21 est. qty.
Total
Stock or Import:

NANCO 27-100
$26.00
$546.00

I

NANCO 27-062
$32.25
$967.50

I

FS 354-856
$155.00
$3,410.00

I

NANCO 28-225
$21.00
$210.00

I

25-240

$41.00
$738.00
I

25-236

$44.50
$934.50
I

TITAN, 475318
$26.04
$546.84

S

TITAN, 474301
$33.33
$999.90

S

TITAN, 47434A
$116.66
$2,566.52

S

DURO, HF207, 372070810
$8.33

$83.30

S

SOLIDEAL, IND, 1001010
$35.41

$637.38

S

SOLIDEAL, IND, 10211014
$44.79

$940.59

S

214-437-146 POW RB
$43.85

$920.85

Import

202-093-440 1T323
$67.55
$2,026.50

NO BID 107 - 115
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111.750 X 10, Industrial (Forklift), Tube Type, Lug
Tread, 12 PR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.
Bid Price: Unit 8 est. qty.
Total
Stock or Import:
112.700 X 12, Industrial (Forklift), Tube Type, Lug
Tread, 12 PR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.
Bid Price: Unit 25 est. qty.
Total
Stock or Import:
113.250 X 15, Industrial (Forklift), Tube Type, 16 PR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:
Bid Price: Unit 12 est. qty.
Total
Stock or Import:
114.8.25 X 15-F, Industrial (Forklift), Lug Tread, 12 PR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:
Bid Price: Unit 2 est. qty.
Total
Stock or Import:
115.28 X 9 X 15, Industrial (Forklift), Tube Type, Lug
Tread, 12 PR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:
Bid Price: Unit 13 est. qty.
Total
Stock or Import:
116.10.5 X 20-E, Industrial, Multi-Purpose, Traction, 10 PR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:
Bid Price: Unit 2 est. qty.
Total
Stock or Import:

25-220

$68.50
$548.00
I

25-190

$55.00
$1,375.00
I

NO BID

25-115

$90.50
$181.00
I

25-130

$92.00
$1,196.00
I

FS 342-548
$267.50
$535.00

I

SOLIDEAL, IND, 10211020
$67.70

$541.60

S

SOLIDEAL, IND, 10211022
$55.20

$1,380.00

S

SOLIDEAL, IND, 30211120
$120.83

$1,449.96

S

SOLIDEAL, IND, 10211044
$89.58

$179.16

S

SOLIDEAL, IND, 1001052
$93.74

$1,218.62

S

SOLIDEAL, IND, 10911325
$209.36
$418.72

S

123-892-417 IND SG MPT|
$251.30
$502.60

Import
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IX. HIGHWAY RIB OR TRAILER TIRES
117.5.70 X 8, Tubeless, Highway Rib or Highway
Trailer, 6 PR
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.
Bid Price: Unit
Total
Stock or Import:

PART 2 - UNMOUNTED TIRES

TUBES, PLAIN INNER, PNEUMATIC

. TRAILER TIRES

118.8.25PR15, Long Metal Valve Stem

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.

Bid Price: Unit
Total

Stock or Import:

. TRUCK AND BUS TUBES, HEAVY-DUTY
119.7.50 X 15, Long Rubber Valve Stem
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.
Bid Price: Unit
Total
Stock or Import:
120.7.50 X 16, Long Rubber Valve Stem
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.
Bid Price: Unit
Total
Stock or Import:
121.9.50/10R16.5
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.

Bid Price: Unit 2 est. qty.
Total
Stock or Import:

122.10 X 16.5
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.
Bid Price: Unit
Total
Stock or Import:

15 est. qty.

6 est. qty.

20 est. qty.

6 est. qty.

12 est. qty.

NANCO 29-304
$15.50
$232.50

I

NANCO 38-181
$20.00
$120.00

I

NANCO 39-115
$10.00
$200.00

I

NANCO 39-115
$10.00
$60.00

I

NANCO 38-210
$15.00
$30.00

I

NANCO 38-210
$15.00
$180.00

I

DURO, SAWTOOTH,
352320856

$16.67

$250.05
S

FST, 520799
$12.50
$75.00

S

FST, 532762
$7.29
$145.80

S

FST, 533912
$7.55
$45.30

S

FST, 538760
$8.33
$16.66

S

FST, 533432
$12.50
$150.00

S

NO BID 117 - 134
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ITEM

BFS RETAIL &
COMMERCIAL
OPERATIONS HAWAII
TIRE WHOLESALE

EAST BAY TIRE CO.

123.9.00 X 20, Metal Valve Stem
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.

Bid Price: Unit 6 est. qty.
Total
Stock or Import:

124.10.00 X 20, Metal Valve Stem
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.

Bid Price: Unit 38 est. qty.
Total
Stock or Import:

125.11.00 X 20, Metal Valve Stem, Contractor must stock
at least 10 tubes for the Division of Refuse
Collection and Disposal emergency purchases
during the first 11 months of the contract regardless
of whether bidding "Stock" or "Import"
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.

Bid Price: Unit 54 est. qty.
Total
Stock or Import:

126.12.00 X 20, Metal Valve Stem
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.

Bid Price: Unit 16 est. qty.
Total
Stock or Import:

lll. FARM, INDUSTRIAL, TRACTOR TUBES, HEAVY-DUTY:

NANCO 38-177
$15.00
$90.00

I

NANCO 38-170
$15.00
$570.00

I

NANCO 38-160
$20.00
$1,080.00

I

NANCO 38-150
$22.00
$352.00

I

127.4.10/350-6
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.
Bid Price: Unit 12 est. qty.
Total
Stock or Import:
128.4.80/4.00 X 8
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.
Bid Price: Unit 20 est. qty.
Total
Stock or Import:

NANCO 43-155
$10.00
$120.00

I

NANCO 45 135
$10.00
$200.00

I

FST, 532193
$10.68
$64.08

S

FST, 540234
$10.68
$405.84

S

FST, 540242
$16.93
$914.22

S

FST, 540242
$17.45
$279.20

S

FST, 533246
$4.17
$50.04

S

FST, 533149
$5.00
$100.00

S
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ITEM

BFS RETAIL &
COMMERCIAL
OPERATIONS HAWAII
TIRE WHOLESALE

EAST BAY TIRE CO.

129.5.70/500 X 8
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.

Bid Price: Unit 13 est.
Total

Stock or Import:

130.6.50 X 10

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.

Bid Price: Unit 24 est.
Total

Stock or Import:

131.7.50 X 10
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.

Bid Price: Unit 14 est.
Total
Stock or Import:

132.7.00 X 12
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.
Bid Price: Unit
Total
Stock or Import:
133.8.15 X 15, Long Metal Valve Stem
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.
Bid Price: Unit
Total
Stock or Import:

IV. LOADER TUBES, HEAVY-DUTY:
134.16.9/18.4 X 28, Metal Valve Stem
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.
Bid Price: Unit
Total
Stock or Import:

28 est.

21 est.

2 est.

qty.

qty.

qty.

qty.

qty.

qty.

NANCO 41-160
$10.00
$130.00

I

NANCO 41-146
$10.00
$240.00

I

NANCO 41-145
$10.00
$140.00

I

NANCO 41-135
$10.00
$280.00

I

NANCO 41-115
$15.00
$315.00

I

NANCO 38-265
$40.00
$80.00

I

FST, 533262
$5.47
$71.11

S

FST, 543098
$7.81
$187.44

S

FST, 542857
$7.81
$109.34

S

FST, 533343
$7.81
$218.68

S

FST, 540625
$9.37
$196.77

S

FST, 532142
$24.48
$48.96

S




