
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14506 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  OCTOBER 25, 2004

For the furnishing of GROUND MAINTENANCE ROYAL
SERVICES AT VARIOUS AREAS FOR DISTRICT AKAHI CLEAN- DIVERSI- FAGASA & LAND- LAWNS BY MPA RANDAL PALM Y2
III, for a twelve (12) month period beginning SERVICES BUSTERS FIED SONS INC. SCAPE ROBERT TREE K. T. MEW CONSTR.  & KLEENING
November 1, 2004 and ending October 31, 2005 INC. JANITORIAL CONCEPTS, SERVICES LANDSC.,
to the Department of Parks and Recreation, SERVICES, INC. INC.
City and County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii. INC.

ITEM
NO. GROUP I
1. Kamaio Neighborhood Park

Bid Price Unit 12 $822.79 ITEMS 1 - 3 $1,520.00 $2,500.00 $1,100.00 $370.00 ITEMS 1 - 3 $325.00 $8,000.00 ITEMS 1 - 12
Total $9,873.48 NO BID $18,240.00 $30,000.00 $13,200.00 $4,440.00 NO BID $3,900.00 $96,000.00 NO BID

2. Kaonohi Park
Bid Price Unit 12 $875.88 $1,625.00 $2,000.00 $1,200.00 $370.00 $347.00 $8,000.00

Total $10,510.56 $19,500.00 $24,000.00 $14,400.00 $4,440.00 $4,164.00 $96,000.00
3. Manana Kai Neighborhood Park

Bid Price Unit 12 $1,035.13 $1,625.00 $2,000.00 $1,100.00 $370.00 $295.00 $9,000.00
Total $12,421.56 $19,500.00 $24,000.00 $13,200.00 $4,440.00 $3,540.00 $108,000.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP I: $32,805.60 $57,240.00 $78,000.00 $40,800.00 $13,320.00 $11,604.00 $300,000.00

GROUP II
4. Moanalua Road-Kaahumanu Medial Strip

Bid Price Unit 12 $212.33 $400.00 $250.00 $1,500.00 $430.00 $90.00 $536.00 $74.00 $475.00
Total $2,547.96 $4,800.00 $3,000.00 $18,000.00 $5,160.00 $1,080.00 $6,432.00 $888.00 $5,700.00

5. Overpass:  Hoolaulea Street-Noelani Street
Bid Price Unit 12 $212.33 $200.00 $185.00 $700.00 $225.00 $35.00 $536.00 $39.00 $475.00

Total $2,547.96 $2,400.00 $2,220.00 $8,400.00 $2,700.00 $420.00 $6,432.00 $468.00 $5,700.00
6. Overpass:  Hoolaulea Street-Nanakai Street

Bid Price Unit 12 $212.33 $200.00 $185.00 $800.00 $225.00 $35.00 $536.00 $39.00 $475.00
Total $2,547.96 $2,400.00 $2,220.00 $9,600.00 $2,700.00 $420.00 $6,432.00 $468.00 $5,700.00

7. Overpass:  Waimanu Home Road-Noelani
Street
Bid Price Unit 12 $212.33 $200.00 $185.00 $700.00 $225.00 $35.00 $536.00 $39.00 $475.00

Total $2,547.96 $2,400.00 $2,220.00 $8,400.00 $2,700.00 $420.00 $6,432.00 $468.00 $5,700.00
8. Overpass:  Waimanu Home Road-Nankai

Street
Bid Price Unit 12 $212.33 $200.00 $185.00 $1,000.00 $225.00 $35.00 $536.00 $39.00 $475.00

Total $2,547.96 $2,400.00 $2,220.00 $12,000.00 $2,700.00 $420.00 $6,432.00 $468.00 $5,700.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP II $12,739.80 $14,400.00 $11,880.00 $56,400.00 $15,960.00 $2,760.00 $32,160.00 $2,760.00 $28,500.00
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GROUP III INC.
9. Pacific Palisades Entrance Park and Medial

Strip
Bid Price Unit 12 $796.25 ITEMS 9 - 12 $1,475.00 $2,500.00 $325.00 $226.00 NO BID $227.00 $1,000.00

Total $9,555.00 NO BID $17,700.00 $30,000.00 $3,900.00 $2,712.00 $2,724.00 $12,000.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP III: $9,555.00 $17,700.00 $30,000.00 $3,900.00 $2,712.00 $2,724.00 $12,000.00

GROUP IV
10. Kuala Street, Ewa side

Bid Price Unit 12 $456.52 $720.00 $1,000.00 $95.00 $140.00 $1,020.00 $127.00 $600.00
Total $5,478.24 $8,640.00 $12,000.00 $1,140.00 $1,680.00 $12,240.00 $1,524.00 $7,200.00

11. Kuala Street, Medial Strip
Bid Price Unit 12 $424.67 $910.00 $800.00 $390.00 $244.00 $945.00 $329.00 $600.00

Total $5,096.04 $10,920.00 $9,600.00 $4,680.00 $2,928.00 $11,340.00 $3,948.00 $7,200.00
12. Kuala Street, Diamond Head side

Bid Price Unit 12 $456.52 $720.00 $1,200.00 $95.00 $130.00 $875.00 $101.00 $600.00
Total $5,478.24 $8,640.00 $14,400.00 $1,140.00 $1,560.00 $10,500.00 $1,212.00 $7,200.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP IV: $16,052.52 $28,200.00 $36,000.00 $6,960.00 $6,168.00 $34,080.00 $6,684.00 $21,600.00

GROUP V
13. Ewa Beach Right-of-Way, Oneula Palce ITEMS 13 - 27 ITEMS 13 - 27

Bid Price Unit 12 $212.33 $128.00 $50.00 $85.00 NO BID $46.00 $150.00 NO BID $195.00 $45.50
Total $2,547.96 $1,536.00 $600.00 $1,020.00 $552.00 $1,800.00 $2,340.00 $546.00

14. Ewa Beach Righ-of-Way, Pupu Place
Bid Price Unit 12 $212.33 $128.00 $50.00 $85.00 $46.00 $150.00 $195.00 $45.50

Total $2,547.96 $1,536.00 $600.00 $1,020.00 $552.00 $1,800.00 $2,340.00 $546.00
15. Beach Right-of-Way adjacent to 91-129 Ewa

Beach Road, makai
Bid Price Unit 12 $212.33 $128.00 $50.00 $85.00 $46.00 $150.00 $195.00 $45.50

Total $2,547.96 $1,536.00 $600.00 $1,020.00 $552.00 $1,800.00 $2,340.00 $546.00

16. Beach Right-of-Way adjacent to 91-173 Ewa
Beach Road, makai
Bid Price Unit 12 $212.33 $128.00 $50.00 $85.00 $46.00 $150.00 $195.00 $45.50

Total $2,547.96 $1,536.00 $600.00 $1,020.00 $552.00 $1,800.00 $2,340.00 $546.00
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17. Beach Right-of-Way adjacent to 91-174 Ewa

Beach Road, mauka
Bid Price Unit 12 $212.33 $128.00 $50.00 $85.00 $46.00 $150.00 $195.00 $45.50

Total $2,547.96 $1,536.00 $600.00 $1,020.00 $552.00 $1,800.00 $2,340.00 $546.00
18. Beach Right-of-Way adjacent to 91-277A Ewa

Beach Road, makai
Bid Price Unit 12 $212.33 $128.00 $50.00 $85.00 $46.00 $150.00 $195.00 $45.50

Total $2,547.96 $1,536.00 $600.00 $1,020.00 $552.00 $1,800.00 $2,340.00 $546.00
19. Beach Right-of-Way adjacent to 91-276 Ewa

Beach Road, mauka
Bid Price Unit 12 $212.33 $128.00 $50.00 $85.00 $46.00 $150.00 $195.00 $45.50

Total $2,547.96 $1,536.00 $600.00 $1,020.00 $552.00 $1,800.00 $2,340.00 $546.00
20. Beach Right-of-Way adjacent to 91-325 Ewa

Beach Road, makai
Bid Price Unit 12 $212.33 $128.00 $50.00 $85.00 $46.00 $150.00 $195.00 $45.50

Total $2,547.96 $1,536.00 $600.00 $1,020.00 $552.00 $1,800.00 $2,340.00 $546.00
21. Beach Right-of-Way adjacent to 91-330 Ewa

Beach Road, mauka
Bid Price Unit 12 $212.33 $128.00 $50.00 $85.00 $46.00 $150.00 $195.00 $45.50

Total $2,547.96 $1,536.00 $600.00 $1,020.00 $552.00 $1,800.00 $2,340.00 $546.00
22. Beach Right-of-Way adjacent to 91-381A Ewa

Beach Road, makai
Bid Price Unit 12 $185.79 $128.00 $50.00 $85.00 $46.00 $150.00 $195.00 $45.50

Total $2,229.48 $1,536.00 $600.00 $1,020.00 $552.00 $1,800.00 $2,340.00 $546.00
23. Beach Right-of-Way adjacent to 91-382 Ewa

Beach Road, mauka
Bid Price Unit 12 $185.79 $128.00 $50.00 $85.00 $46.00 $150.00 $195.00 $45.50

Total $2,229.48 $1,536.00 $600.00 $1,020.00 $552.00 $1,800.00 $2,340.00 $546.00

24. Beach Right-of-Way adjacent to 91-443 Ewa
Beach Road, makai
Bid Price Unit 12 $212.33 $128.00 $50.00 $85.00 $46.00 $150.00 $195.00 $45.50

Total $2,547.96 $1,536.00 $600.00 $1,020.00 $552.00 $1,800.00 $2,340.00 $546.00
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25. Beach Right-of-Way adjacent to 91-443 Ewa

Beach Road, mauka
Bid Price Unit 12 $212.33 $128.00 $120.00 $85.00 $46.00 $150.00 $195.00 $45.50

Total $2,547.96 $1,536.00 $1,440.00 $1,020.00 $552.00 $1,800.00 $2,340.00 $546.00
26. Beach Righ-of-Way adjacent to 91-503 Ewa

Beach Road, makai
Bid Price Unit 12 $212.33 $128.00 $50.00 $85.00 $46.00 $150.00 $195.00 $45.50

Total $2,547.96 $1,536.00 $600.00 $1,020.00 $552.00 $1,800.00 $2,340.00 $546.00
27. Beach Righ-of-Way 91-053 Parish Dirve

Bid Price Unit 12 $371.58 $128.00 $50.00 $85.00 $46.00 $150.00 $195.00 $45.50
Total $4,458.96 $1,536.00 $600.00 $1,020.00 $552.00 $1,800.00 $2,340.00 $546.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP V: $39,493.44 $23,040.00 $9,840.00 $15,300.00 $8,280.00 $27,000.00 $35,100.00 $8,190.00


