
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14499 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  OCTOBER 20, 2004

For the furnishing and delivery of VARIOUS
POLICE EQUIPMENT AND GASPRO ELITE DON HUME MAGNUM SECURITY SUN UNIFORMS
ACCESSORIES for the twelve-month UNIFORMS, INC. LEATHERGOODS FIREARMS EQUIPMENT INDUSTRIES HAWAII
period beginning November 15, 2004 and INC. CORPORATION INC. CORPORATION
ending November 14, 2005, to the Honolulu
Police Department, City and County of
Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

ITEM
NO. GROUP I
1. Handcuffs

Bid Price Unit 200 each NO BID NO BID NO BID $20.00 $19.70 NO BID NO BID
Total 1 - 31 1 - 4 $4,000.00 $3,940.00 1 - 36 1 - 8

Brand Name and Number: as specified Peerless Standard 
Model #M700 

GROUP II
2. Holsters; for the right hand

Bid Price Unit 300 each $59.56 $90.00 $98.00
Total $17,868.00 $27,000.00 $29,400.00

Brand Name and Number: Don Hume as specified Safariland Model 
Leathergoods, Inc. 070-418-161 

H746-SH-P 
3. Holsters; for the left hand

Bid Price Unit 200 each $59.56 $90.00 $98.00
Total $11,912.00 $18,000.00 $19,600.00

Brand Name and Number: Don Hume as specified Safariland Model 
Leathergoods, Inc. 070-418-162 

H746-SH-P 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP II: $29,780.00 $45,000.00 $49,000.00

GROUP III
4. Magazines

Bid Price Unit 100 each NO BID $25.00 $25.80
Total $2,500.00 $2,580.00

Brand Name and Number: as specified Smith & Wesson 
190590000 
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GASPRO ELITE DON HUME MAGNUM SECURITY SUN UNIFORMS
UNIFORMS, INC. LEATHERGOODS FIREARMS EQUIPMENT INDUSTRIES HAWAII

INC. CORPORATION INC. CORPORATION

ITEM
NO. GROUP IV
5. Sam Browne Waist Belts; chrome buckle

Bid Price Unit 500 each $28.28 $23.16 NO BID $28.90
Total $14,140.00 $11,580.00 5 - 17 $14,450.00

Brand Name and Number: Aker B03-HPD-BP Don Hume Aker Model B03- 
Leathergoods, Inc. HPD-BP with 

B102-P Chrome Buckle 
Weight of Leather:  Belt - 11 oz. bends 10 ounces 11 ounce bends 

                             Lining - 4 - 5 oz. 5 ounces 4-5 ounces 

6. Sam Browne Waist Belts; brass buckle
Bid Price Unit 10 each $28.28 $23.16 $28.90

Total $282.80 $231.60 $289.00
Brand Name and Number: Aker Don Hume Aker Model B03- 

B03-HPD-BP (B) Leathergoods, Inc. HPD-BP with Brass 
B102-P Buckle 

Weight of Leather:  Belt - 11 oz. bends 10 ounces 11 ounce bends 

                             Lining - 4 - 5 oz. 5 ounces 4-5 ounces 

7. Sally Brown Waist Belts; chrome buckle
Bid Price Unit 100 each $34.25 $23.16 $33.50

Total $3,425.00 $2,316.00 $3,350.00
Brand Name and Number: Aker Don Hume Aker Model 

B03-W-HPD-BP Leathergoods, Inc. B03-W-HPD-BP 
B102-L-P 

Weight of Leather:  Belt - 11 oz. bends 10 ounces 11 ounce bends 

                             Lining - 4 - 5 oz. 5 ounces 4-5 ounces 
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GASPRO ELITE DON HUME MAGNUM SECURITY SUN UNIFORMS
UNIFORMS, INC. LEATHERGOODS FIREARMS EQUIPMENT INDUSTRIES HAWAII

INC. CORPORATION INC. CORPORATION

ITEM
NO.
8. Sally Browne Waist Belts; brass buckle

Bid Price Unit 10 each $34.25 $23.16 $33.50
Total $342.50 $231.60 $335.00

Brand Name and Number: Aker Don Hume Aker Model 
B03-W-HPD-BP (B) Leathergoods, Inc. B03-W-HPD-BP 

B102-P 
Weight of Leather:  Belt - 11 oz. bends 10 ounces 11 ounce bends 

                             Lining - 4 - 5 oz. 5 ounces 4-5 ounces 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP IV: $18,190.30 $14,359.20 $18,424.00

GROUP V
A.  Police Caps for Male Officers
Standard Type

9. All sizes
Bid Price Unit 300 each $54.75 NO BID NO BID $51.35

Total $16,425.00 9 - 24 9 - 17 $15,405.00
Brand Name and Number: Lancaster #57 Lancaster Style 57 

With One Row of Gold Braid
10. All sizes

Bid Price Unit 50 each $98.25 $96.35
Total $4,912.50 $4,817.50

Brand Name and Number: Lancaster #57 (1R) Lancaster 57 Style 
w/1 row gold braid 
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GASPRO ELITE DON HUME MAGNUM SECURITY SUN UNIFORMS
UNIFORMS, INC. LEATHERGOODS FIREARMS EQUIPMENT INDUSTRIES HAWAII

INC. CORPORATION INC. CORPORATION

ITEM
NO. With Two Rows of Gold Braid
11. All sizes

Bid Price Unit 25 each $107.25 $107.60
Total $2,681.25 $2,690.00

Brand Name and Number: Lancaster #57 (2R) Lancaster 57 Style 
w/2 ros gold braid 

Police Cap Bands
12. Chrome band

Bid Price Unit 10 each $7.50 $6.25
Total $75.00 $62.50

Brand Name and Number: Lancaster CSC Lancaster "snake" 
chrome cap band 

13. Gold band
Bid Price Unit 10 each $7.50 $6.25

Total $75.00 $62.50
Brand Name and Number: Lancaster CSG Lancaster/gold band 

14. Police Cap Covers
Bid Price Unit 100 each $3.45 $3.12

Total $345.00 $312.00
Brand Name and Number: Lancaster RC Lancaster RC 

B.  Police Caps for Female Officers
Standard Type

15. Bid Price Unit 50 each $61.75 $59.90
Total $3,087.50 $2,995.00

Brand Name and Number: Lancaster #700 Lancaster 700 
Tanner Style 
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GASPRO ELITE DON HUME MAGNUM SECURITY SUN UNIFORMS
UNIFORMS, INC. LEATHERGOODS FIREARMS EQUIPMENT INDUSTRIES HAWAII

INC. CORPORATION INC. CORPORATION

ITEM
NO. With One Row of Gold Braid
16. Bid Price Unit 5 each $101.65 $98.43

Total $508.25 $492.15
Brand Name and Number: Lancaster #700 (1R) Lancaster 700 

Tanner Style w/1 row
gold braid 

With Two Rows of Gold Braid
17. All sizes

Bid Price Unit 5 each $111.30 $106.77
Total $556.50 $533.85

Brand Name and Number: Lancaster #700 (2R) Lancaster 700 
Tanner Style w/2 row

gold braid 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP V: $28,666.00 $27,370.50

GROUP VI
18. Baton

Bid Price Unit 10 each NO BID $50.00 $53.84 NO BID
Total 18 - 24 $500.00 $538.40 18 - 39

Brand Name and Number: ASP F26E Armament Systems & 
Procedures Tactical Baton 

Model F26E 
19. Case Holder

Bid Price Unit 100 each $22.00 $22.06
Total $2,200.00 $2,206.00

Brand Name and Number: ASP 52632 Armament Systems & 
Procedures Model 2632 

20. Retaining Cap
Bid Price Unit 10 each $16.00 $1.95

Total $160.00 $19.50
Brand Name and Number: as specified Armament Systems & 

Procedures Retaining Cap 
for F26E 
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GASPRO ELITE DON HUME MAGNUM SECURITY SUN UNIFORMS
UNIFORMS, INC. LEATHERGOODS FIREARMS EQUIPMENT INDUSTRIES HAWAII

INC. CORPORATION INC. CORPORATION

ITEM
NO.

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP VI: $2,860.00 $2,763.90

GROUP VII
A.  Flashlight Kits

21. Flashlight Kit
Bid Price Unit 250 each $75.00 $72.50

Total $18,750.00 $18,125.00
Brand Name and Number: Streamlight - 76475 Streamlight 

Model 76475 

Battery Recharges: up to 1000 1000 times 
Continuous Use Between Charges: 1.5 hours One Hour 
Bulb Candlepower: up to 15,000 peak 15,000 

beam Candlepower 
Demensions: 7.38" long, 1.60" 7.4 inches 

diameter of head, 
1.08" diam body 

Weight: 8.7 oz 8.7 ounces 

B.  Accessories
22. Flashlight Battery

Bid Price Unit 500 each $12.00 $12.44
Total $6,000.00 $6,220.00

Brand Name and Number: Streamlight - 75175 Streamlight 
Model 75175 

Battery Recharges: up to 1000 1000 times 
Voltage: 3.6 volt 3.6 Volts 
Amp Hour: 1.8 2.5 
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GASPRO ELITE DON HUME MAGNUM SECURITY SUN UNIFORMS
UNIFORMS, INC. LEATHERGOODS FIREARMS EQUIPMENT INDUSTRIES HAWAII

INC. CORPORATION INC. CORPORATION

ITEM
NO.
23. Flashlight Bulb

Bid Price Unit 100 each $4.00 $3.94
Total $400.00 $394.00

Brand Name and Number: Sreamlight #75914 Streamlight 
Model 75914 

Bulb Candlepower: up to 15,000 peak 15,000 
beam Candlepower 

Voltage: 3.6 3.7 Volts 
Wattage: 6.3 6 watts 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP VII: $25,150.00 $24,739.00

GROUP VIII
24. Pepper Spray

Bid Price Unit 500 each NO BID 6.03
Total 24 - 36 $3,015.00

Brand Name and Number: Aerko, Punch II 
Model M-3 

GROUP IX
A.  Handcuff Pouches

25. Handcuff pouches; nickel type
Bid Price Unit 200 each $14.75 $13.58 $13.99

Total $2,950.00 $2,716.00 $2,798.00
Brand Name and Number: Aker A500-BP Don Hume Aker Model 500-BP 

Leathergoods, Inc. Nickel 
C304-P 

26. Handcuff pouches; brass type
Bid Price Unit 100 each $14.75 $13.58 $13.99

Total $1,475.00 $1,358.00 $1,399.00
Brand Name and Number: Aker A500-BP (B) Don Hume Aker Model 500-BP 

Leathergoods, Inc. brass 
C304-P 
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GASPRO ELITE DON HUME MAGNUM SECURITY SUN UNIFORMS
UNIFORMS, INC. LEATHERGOODS FIREARMS EQUIPMENT INDUSTRIES HAWAII

INC. CORPORATION INC. CORPORATION

ITEM
NO.

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP IXA: $4,425.00 $4,074.00 $4,197.00

B.  Magazine Pouches
27. Nickel/chrome type

Bid Price Unit 200 each $18.21 $14.86 $17.60
Total $3,642.00 $2,972.00 $3,520.00

Brand Name and Number: Aker A510-BP-2 Don Hume Aker Model A510- 
Leathergoods, Inc. BP-2 Nickel/chrome 

D407 T-P 
28. Brass type

Bid Price Unit 100 each $18.21 $14.86 $17.60
Total $1,821.00 $1,486.00 $1,760.00

Brand Name and Number: Aker A510-BP-2 (B) Don Hume Aker Model A510- 
Leathergoods, Inc. BP-2 Brass 

D407 T-P 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP IXB: $5,463.00 $4,458.00 $5,280.00

C.  Flashlight Pouches
29. Nickel type

Bid Price Unit 100 each $14.85 $11.94 $14.76
Total $1,485.00 $1,194.00 $1,476.00

Brand Name and Number: Aker A556XT-BP Don Hume Aker Model 
Leathergoods, Inc. A556X7-BP-Nickel 

D111 PS-F-P 
30. Brass type

Bid Price Unit 100 each $14.85 $11.94 $14.76
Total $1,485.00 $1,194.00 $1,476.00

Brand Name and Number: Aker A556XT-BP (B) Don Hume Aker Model 
Leathergoods, Inc. A556RT-BP-Brass 

D111 PS-F-P 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP IXC: $2,970.00 $2,388.00 $2,952.00
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GASPRO ELITE DON HUME MAGNUM SECURITY SUN UNIFORMS
UNIFORMS, INC. LEATHERGOODS FIREARMS EQUIPMENT INDUSTRIES HAWAII

INC. CORPORATION INC. CORPORATION

ITEM
NO.
31. Pouch for Pepper Spray

Bid Price Unit 500 each $16.33 $11.65 $15.73
Total $8,165.00 $5,825.00 $7,865.00

Brand Name and Number: Aker A575-BP-V Don Hume Aker Model 575A- 
Leathergoods, Inc. BP-V 

C309 F-2 oz P 

GROUP X
32. Pocket Mask with One-Way Valve

Bid Price Unit 10 each $10.97 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $109.70 32 - 39 32 - 39 32 - 36

Brand Name and Number: ----- 

33. One-Way Valve
Bid Price Unit 10 each $4.09

Total $40.90
Brand Name and Number: ----- 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP X: $150.60

GROUP XI
34. Face Shield with Anti-Reflux Valve

Bid Price Unit 10 each NO BID
Total 34 - 36

Brand Name and Number:
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GASPRO ELITE DON HUME MAGNUM SECURITY SUN UNIFORMS
UNIFORMS, INC. LEATHERGOODS FIREARMS EQUIPMENT INDUSTRIES HAWAII

INC. CORPORATION INC. CORPORATION

ITEM
NO.
35. Face Shield with Anti-Reflux Valve & Pouch

Bid Price Unit 10 each
Total

Brand Name and Number:

Make and Model No. of Gloves:

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XI:

GROUP XII
36. Evidence Security Tape

Bid Price Unit 20 cases
Total

Brand Name and Number:

Dimensions - width x length:

Unit of Purchase - Packaging:

37. Gloves
Bid Price Unit 3,000 pairs $1.35 $1.79 $1.35 $1.42

Total $4,050.00 $5,370.00 $4,050.00 $4,260.00
Brand Name and Number: ----- Hatch WG1000 Hatch Model Centry 1050WMEL 

WG1000 

38. Measuring Wheels
Bid Price Unit 100 each NO BID NO BID $25.56 $27.73

Total 38 & 39 38 & 39 $2,556.00 $2,773.00
Brand Name and Number: Rolatape Rolatape MM12 

Model MM12 
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GASPRO ELITE DON HUME MAGNUM SECURITY SUN UNIFORMS
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INC. CORPORATION INC. CORPORATION

ITEM
NO.
39. Tire Crayon

Bid Price Unit 50 packs NO BID NO BID
Total

Brand Name and Number:

Unit of Purchase:


