
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14278 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  DECEMBER 29, 2003

For the furnishing and delivery of
JANITORIAL CHEMICALS for a twelve- ABC CICO WW KYD INC. NOVA PREMIUM TRIPLE F XPEDEX
month period beginning February 1, 2004 CORPORATION ENTERPRISE GRAINGER DISTRIBUTORS INCORPORATED DISTRIBUTING
and ending January 31, 2005 to the City LTD. INC. INC.
and County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

ITEM
NO. GROUP I
1. Detergent, Dishwashing; liquid

Bid Price Unit 35,328 fluid NO BID $0.0782 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.081 $0.0752 $0.125
Total ounces 1 & 2 $2,762.65 1 & 2 $2,861.57 $2,656.67 $4,416.00

Brand Name and Number: Colgate Colgate-Palmolive Colgate Palmolive Colgate/Palmolive 
Palmolive 47430 Ultra 47430 #47430 47430 

Percent of Surfactants: 38% 38% as specified ----- 
ph: 6.5-7.3 6.5-7.3 as specified 6.5-7.3 
Fluid Oz./Bottle and Bottles/Case: 64oz/6/case 64oz/bottle 6/64 oz 6/64oz bottles/ 

6 bottles/cs case 
Unit of Purchase/Cost: 30.06/case 1 bottle/$5.19 28.87 $48.00/case 

2. Detergent, Dishwashing; liquid; gallon size
Bid Price Unit 1,152 gallons $10.32 $8.36 $8.17 $10.51 $9.928 $8.49

Total $11,888.64 $9,630.72 $9,411.84 $12,107.52 $11,437.06 $9,780.48
Brand Name and Number: Colgate Liquid Pot & Flo-Kem Liquid Colgate-Palmolive Colgate Palmolive Carroll Lotionized 

Palmolive Pan Detergent Pot & Pan Plus 04910 #04910 Hand Dish- 
Dtgnt - FL1024 washing Soap 

Percent of Surfactants: 26.24% 28% 28% 26.24 as specified 30.5 
ph: 6.5-7.3 6 to 8 6-8 7.3 ± 0.2 as specified 7.0 
Fluid Oz./Bottle and Bottles/Case: 4gals/case 4 gal/case 4/case 4 4/1 gal 4 gallons/case 

Unit of Purchase/Cost: 41.28/case 33.45 $32.68 1 gallon/$10.51 39.72 $33.96/case 
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ABC CICO WW KYD INC. NOVA PREMIUM TRIPLE F XPEDEX
CORPORATION ENTERPRISE GRAINGER DISTRIBUTORS INCORPORATED DISTRIBUTING

LTD. INC. INC.

ITEM
NO. GROUP II
3. Cleaner/Polish, Furniture

Bid Price Unit 21,888 ounces $0.1695 NO BID $0.1165 NO BID NO BID $0.15 NO BID $0.166
Total $3,710.02 3 - 6 $2,549.95 3 - 6 3 & 4 $3,283.20 3 - 7 $3,633.41

Brand Name and Number: Prolink Furniture Ball-Lemon-Up Butchers Carroll Festival 
Polish (3U021) Sunbonnet Lemon Furniture 

4110230 Polish 
Oz./Can and Cans/Case: 19oz/cn 20oz/can 18oz/can 12/16oz cans/ 

12cn/cs 12cans/case 12 can/cs case 
Unit of Purchase/Cost: case/38.64 each/$2.33 per 1 can/$2.77 $31.87/case 

(3.22/can) can 
4. Cleaner, Stainless Steel

Bid Price Unit 19,392 ounces $0.2231 $0.154 $0.166 $0.156
Total $4,326.36 $2,986.37 $3,219.07 $3,025.15

Brand Name and Number: Prolink Stainless Ball-Luster Apsco Glimmer Carroll Aqua 
Steel Polish Sheen (3U035) 1071 Steel Stainless 

Steel Cleaner 
USDA Approved: yes yes yes yes/ A-7 
Class C: C1 1 no yes 
Water Based: yes yes yes yes 
Oz./Can and Cans/Case: 19oz/cn 20oz/can 16oz/can 12/18oz cans/ 

12cn/cs 12cans/case 12 cans/cs per case 
Unit of Purchase/Cost: cs/42.84 $3.08 per can 1 can/$2.65 33.70 

(3.57/can) 
5. Cleaner, Oven

Bid Price Unit 4,320 ounces NO BID $0.1575 $0.02289 NO BID $0.192
Total 5 - 10 $680.40 $98.88 5 & 6 $829.44

Brand Name and Number: Ball-Hot Shot Easy Off Oven Carroll #80133 
(3U034) & Grill Cleaner Oven& Griddle 

Cleaner 
Ounces/Can and Cans/Case: 20oz/can 6/24oz 12/19oz cans 

12cans/case per case 
Unit of Purchase/Cost: $3.15 per can $32.95 $43.78 per case 
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ABC CICO WW KYD INC. NOVA PREMIUM TRIPLE F XPEDEX
CORPORATION ENTERPRISE GRAINGER DISTRIBUTORS INCORPORATED DISTRIBUTING

LTD. INC. INC.

ITEM
NO.
6. Polish, Metal; cream type

Bid Price Unit 2,736 ounces NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total 6 & 7

Brand Name and Number:

ph:
Ounces/Container and Containers/Case:

Unit of Purchase/Cost:

7. Sealer/Finisher, Floor; liquid
Bid Price Unit 200 gallons $11.27 $7.76 $7.55 $15.33 $9.58

Total $2,254.00 $1,552.00 $1,510.00 $3,066.00 $1,916.00
Brand Name and Number: Buckeye Super Gloss Flo Kem Super Butchers Carroll Down 

Citation Gloss FL140 Amplify 4385110 Under Floor 
Sealer 

ph: 8-10 8 to 9 8-9 8.0 to 8.6 8 
Gallons/Case: 4 gals/case 4 4 4 4/1 gallons per 

case 
Unit of Purchase/Cost: 45.08/case 31.05/case $30.20 1 gal/$15.33 $38.32 

GROUP III
8. Cleaner, Glass; liquid

Bid Price Unit 42,240 fluid $0.0494 $0.06 $0.07 $0.0579 $0.058 $0.0905 $0.048
Total ounces $2,086.66 $2,534.40 $2,956.80 $2,445.70 $2,449.92 $3,822.72 $2,027.52

Brand Name and Number: Flokem FL-358 & Ramsey-Skylight RTU Glass Flo-Kem RTU Butchers Ajax Glass Carroll Winda 
922HL sprayers (5NF25) Cleaner Glass Cleaner Glisten Glass Cleaner RTU Shine Glass 

Cleaner 4309320 #04199 Cleaner #14123 
Fluid Oz./Bottle and Bottles/Case: 32oz - 12/case 32oz (1 quart) per bottle 32oz quarts per 12/32oz 32oz/bottle 12/32 oz 12/32oz bottles/ 

12 bottles per case case-12 12 bottles/cs case 
Unit of Purchase/Cost: 18.97/case $1.92 per quart 25.07 Case - $22.20 1 bottle/$1.86 34.77 $18.43/case 

No. of Sprayers/Filters in Each Case: 6 2 per case 12qts 6 sprayers/case 6 6 12 2 sprayers 
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ABC CICO WW KYD INC. NOVA PREMIUM TRIPLE F XPEDEX
CORPORATION ENTERPRISE GRAINGER DISTRIBUTORS INCORPORATED DISTRIBUTING

LTD. INC. INC.

ITEM
NO. GROUP IV
9. Cleaner, General Purpose; liquid

Bid Price Unit 53,760 fluid $0.0405 $0.103 $0.061 $0.00532 $0.057 $0.0798 $0.054
Total ounces $2,177.28 $5,537.28 $3,279.36 $286.00 $3,064.32 $4,290.05 $2,903.04

Brand Name and Number: Flokem FL-3052 & Ramsey-Power Kleen-It Flo Kem Kleen It Apsco HBC-30 Ajax Quik Solve Carroll Spray 
922HL sprayers Bolt (3UT38) FL3052 1019 #4164 Solves It Cleaner/ 

Degreaser 
Fluid Oz./Bottle and Bottles/Case: 32g - 12/case 32oz (1 quart) per bottle 32oz bottles/ 12/32oz 32oz/bottle 12/32oz 12/32oz bottles 

12 bottles per case 12 per case 12 bottles/cs per case 
Unit of Purchase/Cost: 15.57 $3.27 per quart $23.95 $20.40/case 1 bottle/$1.83 30.66 $20.74 per case 

No. of Sprayers/Filters in Each Case: 6 2 per case 6 sprayers/case 6/case 6 12 2 sprayers/case 

GROUP V
10. Powder, Scouring

Bid Price Unit 69,300 ounces $0.0343 $0.071 NO BID NO BID $0.036 $0.0318 $0.047
Total $2,376.99 $4,920.30 10 & 11 $2,494.80 $2,203.74 $3,257.10

Brand Name and Number: Ajax #4283 Ajax Tools-Ajax Ajax with Ajax Chlorine Colgate/Palmolive 
(1CH06) Chlorine 04283 Cleanser #04283 CPC Ajax 

(Ajax) 04283 
Oz./Can and Cans/Case: 21oz 21oz/can 21oz/can 30/21 oz 30/21oz cans 

30 cans/case 24can/case 30 cans/cs 
Unit of Purchase/Cost: 21.60/case $35.59 per case 1 can/0.76¢ 20.02 $29.61/case 

of 24 
11. Cleanser, Disinfectant Creme

Bid Price Unit 80,640 ounces $0.0913 $0.0783 $0.081 $0.0678 $0.0794 $0.0748 $0.104
Total $7,362.43 $6,314.11 $6,531.84 $5,467.39 $6,402.82 $6,031.87 $8,386.56

Brand Name and Number: ABC Creme Ajax 14942 Ball-Double Time Canberra-Airtech Butchers Double Ajax EPA Colgate/Palmolive 
Cleanser (3U052) D.C. Scrub Play Creme Disinfectant CPC Ajax 

Cleanser 4102320 Cleanser #14942 14942 
Oz/Bottle and Bottles/Case: 32oz/btl 35oz - 9/case 32oz (1 quart) per bottle 12/32oz 32oz/bottle 9/35 oz 9/35oz bottles 

12btls/case 12 bottles per case 12 bottles/cs per case 
Unit of Purchase/Cost: case/35.08 24.68/case $2.58 per quart 26.04 case 1 bottle/$2.54 23.55 $32.76 

(2.92) 
STATE OF HAWAII REGISTRATION NO.: Being processed not applicable 9983.3 8155-8-51215 none ----- ----- 
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ABC CICO WW KYD INC. NOVA PREMIUM TRIPLE F XPEDEX
CORPORATION ENTERPRISE GRAINGER DISTRIBUTORS INCORPORATED DISTRIBUTING

LTD. INC. INC.

ITEM
NO. GROUP VI
12. Bleach, Chlorine; liquid

Bid Price Unit 930 gallons $2.71 NO BID $2.65 $2.67 NO BID $1.70 $1.9424 NO BID
Total $2,520.30 $2,464.50 $2,483.10 $1,581.00 $1,806.43

Brand Name and Number: ABC Pure Bright Clorox-Clo Clorox Ultra Kem Tek Blue Ribbon 
02490 (1VN32) Germicidal Industrial Bleach 

Bleach BLEACH6 
Gal./Container and Containers/Case: 6gal/cs 96oz per conainer 6 bottles 96oz 1 gal/container 6/1 gal 

6 containers per case 6 containers/cs 
Unit of Purchase/Cost: 16.26/cs $15.86 per case $16.02 1 gal/$1.70 11.66 

STATE OF HAWAII REGISTRATION NO.: 9876.2 9176.163 600249025 ----- ----- 

GROUP VII
13. Cleaner, Toilet Bowl; liquid

Bid Price Unit 1,860 quarts NO BID $1.78 $2.04 $2.15 $1.90 $2.57 NO BID $1.67
Total 13 & 14 $3,310.80 $3,794.40 $3,999.00 $3,534.00 $4,780.20 13 & 14 $3,106.20

Brand Name and Number: Flo Kem FL-362 Ball-Anytime Flo-King Flo-Kling Bowl Butchers Depth Carroll Porcelain 
(3U045) Regular Bowl Cleaner FL362 Charge 4314320 & Bowl Cleaner 

Cleaner #7622 
Percent of Hydrogen Chloride: 9.5% 9.5% 9.5% 9.5 15% 9.69% 

Hydrochloric 
Quarts/Case: 12/case 12 quarts per 12 quarts/cs 12 12 quarts/cs 12 qts per case 

case 
Unit of Purchase/Cost: 21.36/case $2.04 each $25.79/case $22.80/case 1 quart/$2.57 $20.04 per case 

quart 
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ABC CICO WW KYD INC. NOVA PREMIUM TRIPLE F XPEDEX
CORPORATION ENTERPRISE GRAINGER DISTRIBUTORS INCORPORATED DISTRIBUTING

LTD. INC. INC.

ITEM
NO.
14. Remover, Toilet Ring

Bid Price Unit 180 quarts NO BID $2.19 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $394.20

Brand Name and Number: Ball-Shape-Up 
(3U049) 

ph: 11.5 - 12.5 

Quarts/Case: 12 quarts per 
case 

Unit of Purchase/Cost: $2.19 per quart 

GROUP VIII
15. Digetant, Enzyme

Bid Price Unit 30,720 fluid $0.0978 $0.0625 $0.25 $0.08437 $0.07 $0.0878 $0.1131 $0.082
Total ounces $3,004.42 $1,920.00 $7,680.00 $2,591.85 $2,150.40 $2,697.22 $3,474.43 $2,519.04

Brand Name and Number: ABC Liquid Cico/Schubert Ramsey-Kil Oder Attack (FL210) Attack FL6328 Apsco LLMO CDC Odor Carroll Enzyme 
Enzyme Attack II Spring Floral RTU Odor Enzyme #CDC35116 Drain Opener 

(3UT15) Eliminator 33001 (Odorend) 
Fluid Oz./Bottle and Bottles/Case: 32oz/12qt/cs 32oz - 12/case 32oz (1 quart) per bottle 32oz/12 bottles 32oz bottles/ 32oz/bottle 12/32 oz 12/32oz bottles 

12 bottles per case per case 12 per case 12 bottles/cs per case 
Unit of Purchase/Cost: 37.56/cs 24.00/case $7.88 per quart 2.50 case $26.40 1 bottle/$2.81 43.45 $31.49 per case 

(3.13/qt) 
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ABC CICO WW KYD INC. NOVA PREMIUM TRIPLE F XPEDEX
CORPORATION ENTERPRISE GRAINGER DISTRIBUTORS INCORPORATED DISTRIBUTING

LTD. INC. INC.

ITEM
NO. GROUP IX
16. Deodorant, Disinfectant

Bid Price Unit 23,400 ounces $0.2155 $0.1725 $0.125 NO BID NO BID $0.1946 NO BID $0.207
Total $5,042.70 $4,036.50 $2,925.00 16 - 20 16 & 17 $4,553.64 16 - 22 $4,843.80

Brand Name and Number: ABC One-Step Buckeye Ball Ruthless Afflab Lemonene Carroll Ocide II 
Disinfectant Sanicare II (3U022) Disinfectant 1056 Hospital 

55019000 Disinfectant 
Oz. Net Weight/Can and Cans/Case: 15.5oz/12cn/cs 16oz - 12/case 20oz/can 12oz/can 12/14oz cans 

12cans/case 12 cans/cs per case 
Unit of Purchase/Cost: 40.13/case 33.12 $2.50 per can 1 can/$2.92 $34.78 per case 

(3.34cn) 
STATE OF HAWAII REGISTRATION NO.: 706-69-56938 #9021 9983.17 ----- 9649.42 

17. Freshener, Air and Odor Eliminator
Bid Price Unit 8,400 ounces $0.5971 NO BID $0.138 $0.15733 NO BID

Total $5,015.64 $1,159.20 $1,321.57 17 - 20
Brand Name and Number: Ecosorb Ball-New Apsco Lemon 

Blossom Air Freshener & 
(5MP26) Deoderant 2020 

Oz. Net Weight/Can and Cans/Case: 14ozcan/12cn/cs 20oz/can 12oz/can 
12cans/case 12 cans/cs 

Unit of Purchase/Cost: 100.32/case $2.75 per can 1 can/$2.36 
(8.36/cn) 
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ABC CICO WW KYD INC. NOVA PREMIUM TRIPLE F XPEDEX
CORPORATION ENTERPRISE GRAINGER DISTRIBUTORS INCORPORATED DISTRIBUTING

LTD. INC. INC.

ITEM
NO.
18. Sanitizer, Air

Bid Price Unit 9,000 ounces NO BID $0.0472 NO BID $0.4875 NO BID
Total 18 - 22 $424.80 18 & 19 $4,387.50 18 & 19

Brand Name and Number: Ozium 7000 Ozium 7000 
Air Sanitizer 

Oz. Net Weight/Can and Cans/Case: 14.5oz - 12/case 14.5oz 

Description of Scent: as specified ----- 

Unit of Purchase/Cost: 82.16 85.00 per case 
of 12 

STATE OF HAWAII REGISTRATION NO.: Not applicable ----- 

GROUP X
19. Block, Urinal Deodorant

Bid Price Unit 4,800 ounces $0.2167 NO BID
Total $1,040.16 19 & 20

Brand Name and Number: Big D 36800 

Oz./Cake and Cakes/Case: 4oz cake 
12/case 

Unit of Purchase/Cost: 10.40/doz 
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ABC CICO WW KYD INC. NOVA PREMIUM TRIPLE F XPEDEX
CORPORATION ENTERPRISE GRAINGER DISTRIBUTORS INCORPORATED DISTRIBUTING

LTD. INC. INC.

ITEM
NO.
20. Screen, Urinal with Deodorant Block

Bid Price Unit 360 each $1.15 $2.48 $1.36
Total $414.00 $892.80 $489.60

Brand Name and Number: Continental Big D (4HK79) Apsco Urinal 
Super Kleen Screen with 

Screen CM-165-1 Block 33012 
Dimensions: as specified ----- 6-3/4 x 6-3/4 x 

1-1/4 
Screens/Case: 12/case 12 12 

Fragrances Available: cherry apple cherry 

Unit of Purchase/Cost: 13.81 29.76 per case 1 each/$1.36 

GROUP XI
21. Pine Oil; liquid

Bid Price Unit 360 gallons $10.44 $17.40 $10.45 $11.50 NO BID $14.49
Total $3,758.40 $6,264.00 $3,762.00 $4,140.00 $5,216.40

Brand Name and Number: Flo Kem #70 Nib (5LG37) Pine Odor #70 Flo-Kem Pine Carroll Pine Oil 
(FL-210) #70 Activated 

Cleaner 
Gal./Container and Containers/Case: 4gal/case 1 gallon, 4 4 gal/case 4 gallons/case 4/1 gallons per 

gallons per case case 
Unit of Purchase/Cost: 41.76/case 17.40 per gallon $41.80 46.00 per case $57.96 
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ABC CICO WW KYD INC. NOVA PREMIUM TRIPLE F XPEDEX
CORPORATION ENTERPRISE GRAINGER DISTRIBUTORS INCORPORATED DISTRIBUTING

LTD. INC. INC.

ITEM
NO. GROUP XII
22. Disinfectant

Bid Price Unit 2,600 gallons $5.20 $11.77 $5.8375 $5.40 $7.81 $8.91
Total $13,520.00 $30,602.00 $15,177.50 $14,040.00 $20,306.00 $23,166.00

Brand Name and Number: Flo Kem Triple 2 Ramsey Triple-2 Flo-Kem Triple 2 Apsco Lemon Carroll Neutracide 
Frequency 64 Germicidal Q 1055 64 Disinfectant/ 

(3UT48) Cleaner Cleaner 
Gal./Container and Containers/Case: 4gal/case 1 gallon, 4 4gal/container 4 gallons/case 1 gal/cont 4/1 gallons per 

gallons per case 4 cont/cs case 
Dilution Ratio: 2oz/gal 64 to 1 1:64 2oz gal 2oz per gallon 1:64 2 oz per gallon 

of water 
Unit of Purchase/Cost: 20.76/case 11.77 23.35 21.60 case 1 gal/$7.81 $35.64 

STATE OF HAWAII REGISTRATION NO.: 1839-95-10693 ----- 1839-95-10693 #1839-95-10693 4313-22-47023 9649.43 


