
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET AND FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
PROPOSAL NO. 14271
OPENED:  DECEMBER 17, 2003
Reqn. No. G05026

For the furnishing and delivery of VETERINARY ABAXIS, INC. ACCUVET HESKA KIMZEY MOPEC, INC. OLYMPUS HENRY SUBURBA UNIVERSAL

EQUIPMENT to the Honolulu Zoo, City and LASER CORPORATION WELDING AMERICA SCHEIN SURGICAL MEDICAL

County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii SURGERY WORKS, INC. INC. CO. INC. SYSTEMS INC.

ITEM
  1. Animal Necropsy Table

Bid Price: 1 each NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $26,296.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Make and Model No.: ITEMS 1 - 18 ITEMS 1 - 13 ITEMS 1 - 18 ITEMS 1 - 6 OA100, ITEMS 1 - 11 ITEMS 1 & 2 ITEMS 1 - 3 ITEMS 1 - 12

Version B

  2. Laboratory Dissecting Light
Bid Price: 1 each $2,609.00
Make and Model No.: BB108

  3. Microscopes
Bid Price: Unit 2 each NO BID ITEMS $1,899.00

Total 3 - 40 $3,798.00
Make and Model No.: Swift

M4002DM

  4. Heated V-top Surgery Table
Bid Price: 1 each $2,649.00 $2,101.44
Make and Model No.: 903-4101.00 SSCI

Shoreline Infinity #102787-01
Plus 910-0100-62

  5. Mobile Instrument Table $1697.00

Bid Price: 1 each $93.59 $850.90
Make and Model No.: Brandt 32000 SSCI

or Shoreline #108431-23
903-2001-00

  6. Single Head Surgical Light Table $815.00

Bid Price: Unit 2 each $1,425.00 $1,667.40
Total $2,850.00 $3,334.80

Make and Model No.: Centurion 041514 or SSCI
Shoreline #MDL041513

913-500-504 $2,111.00 each
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  7. "Smaller Animal" Surgery Table
Bid Price: 1 each $13,915.56 NO BID NO BID
Make and Model No.: Kimzey foal ITEMS

"Smaller 7 - 17
Animal"

  8. Small Animal Anesthesia Ventilator Surgery table
Bid Price: 1 each $2,550.00
Make and Model No.: NO BID Matrx

ITEMS 8 - 40 91806001

  9. Anesthesia Exhaust Scavenger System
Bid Price: 1 each $415.00
Make and Model No.: Matrx

91515179

 10. Anesthesia Monitoring Equipment
Bid Price: 1 each $3,200.00
Make and Model No.: Heska 4800

 11. Aspirator/Irrigator
Bid Price: 1 each NO BID
Make and Model No.: ITEMS

11 & 12

 12. Flexible Endoscope
Bid Price: 1 each $70,829.75
Make and Model No.: EVIS System

Complete; with

CF2T160L

 13. Portable X-ray Unit co/movideoscope

Bid Price: 1 each Quote $8,500.00 $8,400.00
Make and Model No.: #162462-QO Min X-ray PX40HF

NO BID HF100
ITEMS 13-40 tripod=

$250.00
laser

pointer=
$570.00
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 14. CO2 Laser Surgical Unit
Bid Price: 1 each $35,503.88 $25,950.00 NO BID
Make and Model No.: AccuVet Vetroson

LX20SP, see VDL1200
Attachment

 15. Ultrasound "A", "B"
Bid Price: 1 each NO BID $52,000.00
Make and Model No.: NO BID ITEMS BIOSOUND

ITEMS 15-40 15 - 17 MEGAS-ES-
3 PROBES

 16. X-ray Film Cassettes included
Bid Price: Unit 8 each NO BID

Total ITEMS
Make and Model No.: 16 - 40

 17. X-ray Film Viewer "hot light"
Bid Price: 1 each
Make and Model No.:

 18. Platform Scale
Bid Price: 1 each $799.00 $1,000.09
Make and Model No.: Detecto SSCI #'s:

Vet400 209934-0 &
mat=$35.00 209689

 19. Blood Chemistry Analyzer System ac adapter
Bid Price: 1 each $18,749.00 $18,691.00 =$28.50 NO BID
Make and Model No.: Abaxis VetScan Heska Diagnostic

Chemistry Analyzer, Lab System NO BID
Abaxix VetScan HMT (iStat Clinical

 20. Mobile Kennel with O2 therapy door Hematology Analyzer Portable

Bid Price: 1 each NO BID Analyzer 5100, $1,646.00 $1,485.53
Make and Model No.: ITEMS 20-40 Vet 914-3630-06 SSCI

ABCDiff5501, #102305-00
SpotchemEZ

5701)

NO BID
ITEMS 20-40
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 21. Multi-Purpose COJACK Table, "Power Lift"
Bid Price: 1 each $3,976.00 $3,075.45
Make and Model No.: 903-3020-00 SSCI

#102840-00

 22. X-ray Film Safe
Bid Price: 1 each $165.00 NO BID
Make and Model No.: Wolf X-ray ITEMS

25120 22 & 23

 23. Portable Cassette Holder
Bid Price: 1 each NO BID
Make and Model No.:

 24. Floor Movable Exam Light
Bid Price: 1 each $1,800.00 $1,838.00
Make and Model No.: Centura SSCI

#042813 #MDL042813

 25. Plastic Cage Banks with Floor and Pan, 4 unit
banks model
Bid Price: Unit 2 each $1,080.00 NO BID

Total $2,160.00 ITEMS
Make and Model No.: 925-4000-11 25 & 26

 26. Parvo Isolation Cage
Bid Price: 1 each $851.00
Make and Model No.: 925-3931-00

 27. Regal Cage with Removable Floor and Squeeze
Back Panel
Bid Price: 1 each NO BID $1,163.52
Make and Model No.: ITEMS SSCI#'s

27 & 28 102103-2-4;
 102514R
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 28. Stainless Steel Cat Cage Rack
Bid Price: 1 each NO BID
Make and Model No.: ITEMS

28 - 34

 29. Standard Cages
Bid Price: Unit 3 sets $2,282.00

Total (1 set=2 stacked cages on 1 floor $6,846.00
Make and Model No.: stand with wheels) S/L(2) 60X36 DD

on 60" "mobile

platform"

 30. Standard Cages
Bid Price: Unit 3 each $4,800.00

Total $14,400.00
Make and Model No.: S/L 3 unit free

standing run system

with wedge consisting

 31. Standard Cages of (3) 30" gates,

Bid Price: 1 each (4) 60x78 side panels,

Make and Model No.: (3) 30" backs

NO BID

 32. Stackable Cages with Stand
Bid Price: Unit 5 sets $1,468.00

Total (1 set=3 stacked cages on one $7,340.00
Make and Model No.: floor stand with wheels) S/L 36x24 ss

cages with
(1) 36"

 33. Eurocage Display/Breeding Units mobile
Bid Price: Unit 3 sets platform

Total (1 set=2 stacked cages on NO BID
Make and Model No.: one stand) ITEMS

33 & 34
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 34. X-ray Film Storage Shelving
Bid Price: 1 each
Make and Model No.:

 35. Oxygen Therapy Door
Bid Price: 1 each $565.00 $391.98
Make and Model No.: 914-3630-01 SSCI

#102568-1

 36. Mobile Transport Cage
Bid Price: 1 each $1,071.00 $1,141.45
Make and Model No.: 902-0001-00 SSCI

#102295-00

 37. Primate Apartment Module
Bid Price: 1 each NO BID NO BID
Make and Model No.: ITEMS

37 & 38

 38. Versa Cage 4 Unit with Connection
Bid Price: Unit 4 each $910.00

Total $3,640.00
Make and Model No.: 925-4000-01

on STD Base

  39. Regal Deluxe Stacking Cat Cages
Bid Price: Unit 4 each NO BID $487.54

Total ITEMS $1,950.16
Make and Model No.: 39 & 40 SSCI#:

101448-00

  40. Regal Deluxe Stacking Cat Cage Rack
Bid Price: 1 each $963.32
Make and Model No.: SSCI#:

104526-00

Total Sum Bid for Item Nos. 39 & 40 Only: $2,913.48


