ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR
PROPOSAL NO. 14264 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED: DECEMBER 5, 2003

Reqgn. No. G55104, G55105 & G55111

For the furnishing and delivery of Various CUTTER HT&T HAWAII HONOLULU PACIFIC
Motor Vehicles, to the Refuse Division, DODGE INC. LLC dba FORD INC. MACHINERY
Department of Environmental Services, City HT&T TRUCK INC.
and County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii CENTER
Five (5) Only, Subcompact, Pickup Truck
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Dakota Ford Ranger
R10 XL
Year of production model: 2004 2004
Bid Prices:
Vehicle Unit 5 units $20,395.70 NO BID $20,003.26 NO BID
Total $101,978.50 1&2 $100,016.30 1&2
Diagnostic kit: (one (1) Only) $3,645.80 $2,474.16
Manuals Unit 5 sets $250.00 $600.00
Total $1,250.00 $3,000.00
Total Sum Bid: $106,874.30 $105,490.46
BID EVALUATION - Please check one (1):
____Applicable information available X X
____Applicable information not available
BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES
60,000 Miles X $1.40 X 5 Units = $23,333.33 $24,705.88
City EPA MPG 18 17
Total Evaluated Bid Price: $130,207.63 $130,196.34
Delivery in Calendar Days: 210 Days
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CUTTER HT&T HAWAII HONOLULU PACIFIC
DODGE INC. LLC dba FORD INC. MACHINERY
HT&T TRUCK INC.
CENTER
ITEM
NO.
2. Four (4) Only, 6,000 Lb. GVWR Truck Cab
and Chassis with 6 Ft. Pickup Body
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Ram 1500 Ford F150
F12 XL
Year of production model: 2004 2004
Bid Prices:
Vehicle Unit 4 units $22,987.04 $22,611.58
Total $91,948.16 $90,446.32
Diagnostic kit: (one (1) Only) $3,516.70 $2,474.16
Manuals Unit 5 sets $350.00 $600.00
Total $1,750.00 $3,000.00
Total Sum Bid: $97,214.86 $95,920.48
BID EVALUATION - Please check one (1):
____Applicable information available X X
____Applicable information not available
BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES
60,000 Miles X $1.40 X 4 Units = $24,000.00 $24,000.00
City EPA MPG 14 14
Total Evaluated Bid Price: $121,214.86 $119,920.48

Delivery in Calendar Days: 210 Days
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CUTTER HT&T HAWAII HONOLULU PACIFIC
DODGE INC. LLC dba FORD INC. MACHINERY
HT&T TRUCK INC.
CENTER
ITEM
NO.
3. One (1) Only, 31,300 Lb. G.V.W.R. Truck
Cab and Chassis with 20' Stake Body and
3,000 Lb. Capacity Liftgate
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Peterbilt International 4300
Model 330 SBA 4X2 with
Mounted Spartan
Custom Flatbed
Body
Year of production model: 2004 2005
Bid Price NO BID $86,926.20 NO BID $78,359.71

Delivery in Calendar Days: 210 Days




